
G U E R N S E Y  S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T  j 

8 ', ' 
,., ''L> y .. # , ,,, 

''.T I,., ,, i: 
A , , ! s ;  

I \ '  ) 

1992 - No. 17 
The Social Insurance (Classification) (Amendment) 

Ren~lations. 1992 

Made . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  2nd October, 1992 

Laid before the States . . . . . . . . . . . .  

Coming into operation . . . . . . . . . . . .  1st January, 1993 

THE STATES INSURANCE AUTHORITY, in exercise of the 
powers conferred upon it by section 1 and section 116 of the Social Insurance 
(Guernsey) Law, 1978, as amended@), hereby orders:. 

Amendment 

1. Part I11 of the First Schedule to the Social Insurance (Classification) 
(Guernsey) Regulations, 1978, as amended @I, is hereby amended as follows:- 

(a) in paragraph 8(a) of Column (A) thereof for "£27.00" substitute 
"£28.50"; 

(b) in paragraph 8(b) of Column (A) thereof for "£117.00" 
substitute "£123.50". 

2. The Social Insurance (Classification) (Amendment) Regulations, 
1991 (c) are repealed. 

3. These Regulations shall have effect in the Islands of Guernsey, 
Alderney, Herm and Jethou. 

(a) Ordres en Conseil Vol.XXV1, p.292; Vol.XXVI1, pp.238, 307 and 
392; Vol XXIX pp.24, 148 and 422. 

(b) S.I.1978 No.32; S.I.1979 Nos.5 and 28; S.I.1988 No.27; S.I.1991 
N0.37. 

(c) S.I.1991 N0.37. 



Citation 

4. These Regulations may be cited as the Social Insurance (Classification) 
(Amendment) Regulations, 1992. 

Commencement 

5. These Regulations shall come into force on the 1st day of January, 
1993. 

Dated this second day of October, 1992. 

President of the States Insurance Authority 
for and on behalf of the Authority. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Note is not part of the Regulations, but is intended to indicate their 
general purport.) 

These Regulations further amend the Social Insurance (Classification) 
(Guernsey) Reglations, 1978 so as to provide that an insured person who is 
employed under a contract of service from which he derives weekly earnings of 
less than £28.50 or monthly earnings of less than £123.50 shall be treated as a 
non-employed person. 


	page-0001.tif
	page-0002.tif

