GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

1979 - No. &F

The Social Insurance (Incresse of Bemefit) (Guermsey)Remilations, 1979

M.-ade cen es e X 2o e coe 18th Se'ptember, 1979-
Laid before the SHate8 see  aee  oes | '

. Coming into operation ... s ese 19th November, 1979.

THE STATES INSURANCE AUTHORITY, in exercise of powers conferred upon
it by section thirty-nine, section fifiy and section sixby-nine of the Social
Insurance (Guernsey) Law, 1978, and by Part II of the Fourth Schedule to that
Law, and in exercise of all other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby

orders:—

Interpretatiqn

1. (1) In these regulations, except where the context otherwise
requires, the following expressions have the meanings hereby respectively

assigned to them, that is to say:~

"the Law" means the Social Insurance (Cuernsey) Law, 1978;
"the relevant day" means the nineteenth day of November, nineteen
hundred and seveniy-nine; '

and any other expressiong have the same meanings as in the Law.

(2) Except where the context otherwise requires, any reference in
these regulations to any enaciment or regulations shail be construed as including
a reference to that enasctment or those regulations, as the case may be, as
amended, repealed, replaced or revoked by or under any other emactment or by

any oivher regulations.

(3) The Interpretation (Guernsey) Law, 1948, shall apply to the »
interpretation of these regulations as it applies to the interpretation of a

Guernsey enactment.



Higher rates of widow'!s benefit and old age pension payable at reduced rates

-~owing to vartial satisfaction of contribution conditions

2. The Schedule to the Social Insurance (Widow's Benefit and 01d Age
Pensions) (Cuernsey) Regulations, 1978, is hereby repealed and the Schedule
set out in the First Schedule to these reguiations is hereby substituted

therefor. I

Higher rates of unemplovment benefit, sickness benefit and invalidity benefit

payable gb reduced rates owing to partial satisfaction of contribution conditions

(1) The Second Schedule to the Social Insurance (Unemployment,
Sickness and Invalidity Benefit) (Guernsey) Regulations, 1978, is hereby
repealed and the Schedule set out in the Second Schedule to these regulations

is hereby substituted therefor

(2) The Third Schednle %o the Social Insurance (Unemployment,
Sickness and Invalidity Benefit) (Guernsey) Regulations, 1978, is hereby
repealed and the Schedule set out in the Third Schedule to these Tevulati ons

is hereby subsitituted therefor.

Higher rates of maternity sllowance pavable at reduced rales owing to partial

satisfaction of contribution conditions

4. The First Schedule to the Social Insurance (Benefits) (Miscellaneous
Provisions) (Guernsey 7) Regulations, 1978, is hereby repealed and the Schedule
set out in the Fourth Schedule to thess resgulations iz hereby substituted

therefor.

Higher amounts of death grant pavable at reduced amcunts owing to partial

satisfaction cf contribution conditions

5. The Second Schedule to the Social Insurance (Benefits) (Miscellaneous
Provisions) (Guernsey) Regulations, 1978, is hereby repealed and the Schedule
set out in the Fifth Schedule to these regulations is hereby substituted

therefor.



-3 -

Higher rates of increase of industrial disablement benefit under section fifty

of the Law where constant attendance is reguired.

6. The Second Schedule to the Social Insurance (Industrial Injuries
Benefits) (Guernsey) Regulations, 1978, is hereby repealed and the Schedule

set out in the Sixth Schedule to these regulations is hereby substituted therefor.

Amendments to Social Insurance (Benefits) (Transistional Provisions) (Guernsey)

Regulations, 1978

7. (1) The Social Insurance(Benefits) (Transistional Provisions)
(Guernsey) Regulations, 1978, as zmended, are hereby further amended as

follows, that is to say:=

(2) in sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (2) of regulation nineteen
thereof, for the words "six pounds and fifty-five pence" there
are hereby substituted the words "seven pounds and thirty

",
pence";

(b) in sub~paragraph (b) of the said paragraph (2), for the words
"ten pounds and five pence' there are hereby substituted the

words "eleven pounds and thirty pence';

(¢) in sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (2) of regulation thirty~five
thereof, for the words "fority-four pence' there are hereby

substituted the words "fifty pence’;

(d) in sub~paragraph (b) of paragraph (1) and sub-paragraph
(b) of parsgraph {2) of regulation thirty-six thereof, for
the words "twenty-two pence' there are hereby substituted the

words "twenty-five pence'.

(2) TFor the purposes of paragraph (2) of the said regulation
thirty-five and paragrébh (2) of the said regulation thirty—six, any reckonable.
contributions péid in respect of contribution weeks before the nineteenth day
of November,nineteen hundred and seventy-nine, and which do ndt on that day
make up nine (or a multiple of nine) contributions, shall be treated as if they
had been paid in respect of contribution weeks commencing on or after that

date.



-

o Social Insurance (Benefits)ﬂﬂiscellaneous Provisions)

Amendments

(Guernsey) Rezulations, 1978

8. The Social Insurance (Benefits) (Miscellaneous Provisions)(Guernsey)

Regulations, 1978, are hereby amended as follows, that is to say:-

(2) in paragraph (1) of wegulation twenty-eight thereof, for
the words "this Part of these regulations" there are hereby
substituted the words "this regulation';

(t) in paragraph (2) of vegulation twenby-eight and regulation
twenty-nine thereof, for the words "two pounds and sixty

pence" there are hereby substituted the words "three pounds”.

Amendment to Social Insurance {Unemployment, Sickness and Invalidity BeneP;Al
(Guernsey) Regulations, 1978

9. Paragraph (£) of paragraph (1) of regulation six of the Social
Insurance (Unemployment, Sickness ard Invalidity Benefit) (Guermsey)
Regulations, 1978, shall have effect, on or after the first day of Janua
nineteen hundred aﬁd eighty, as if for the words "ten pounds” therein there

were substituted the words ''eleven pounds'.
Citation

10. These regulations may be cited as the Social Imsurance (Tncrease

of Benefit) (Guernsey) Regulations, 1979.

Commencement

11. These regulations shall come into force on the nineteenth day of

November, nineteen hundred and seventy-nine.

Dated this eighteenth day of  September , nineteen hundred and seventy-nine

President of the States Insurance Authority
for and on behalf of the Authority.



Regulation 2

FIRST SCHEDULE
SCHEDULE Regulation six

Showing reduced rates of widow's benefit and old age pension
and of increase of 0ld age pension in respect of an adult
dependant,

(1) (2) (3) (4)

Yéérly average Widow's Widow's pension, widowed
of reckonable Allowance mother's allowance, and old age
contributions pension
paid or
credited Full weekly rate of pension or allowance
£31.20 £22.50 £13.50
Reduced rate at which pension or allowance is
payable
48-49 £30.25 £21.85 £13.1
46-47 £29.00 , £20.95 £12.55
43-15 £27.45 £19.80 £11.90
40-42 £25.60 £18.45 £11.05
37-39 £23.70 £17.10 £10.25
3436 £21.85 £15.75 £ 9.45
30-33 | £19.65 £14.20 £ 8.50
26-29 £17.15 £12.40 | £ 7.45
22-25 £14.65 £10.60 £ 6.35
18-21 | £12.15 £ 8.80 £ 5.25
14-17 £ 9.65 £ 7.00 £ 4.20
10-13 £ 7.20 | £ 5.20 £ 3,10




Regulation 3(1)
SECOND SCHEDULE

SECOND SCHEDULE Regulation twelve

Showing reduced rates of unemployment and sickness benefit and
of increase of benefit in respect of adult dependants

(1)

(2) (3)

Nunmber of reckon-
able conbtributions
paid or credited in
the relevanl contbri-
bution yeax..

Full weekly rate of benefit applicable
under the Social Insurance (Rates of Con=
tributions and Benefits etc.) {Guernsey)
Ordinance, 1979.

£19.20 £11.80

Reduced rate =t which benefit is payable

48-49
46-47
43-45
40-42
37-39
34~36
30-33
26-29

£18.60 £11.45
£17.85 £10.95
£16.90 £10.40
£15.75 £ 9.70
£14.60 £ 8.95
£13.45 £ 8.25
£12.10 £ 7.45
£10.55 ‘ £ 6.50




THIRD SCHEDULE ' Regulation 3(2)

THIRD SCHEDULE Regulation twelve

Showing reduced rates of invalidity benefit and of increase
of benefit in respect of adult dependants

(1)

(2) - (3)

Number of reckon-
able contributions
paid or credited in
the relevant contri-
bution year.

Full weekly rate of benefit applicable
under the Social Insurance (Rates of Con-
tributions and Benefits etc.) (Guernsey)
Ordinance, 1979.

£22.50 £13.50

Reduced rate at which benefit is payable

48-49
46-47
43-45
40-42
37-39
34-%6
30-33
26-29

£21.85 | £13.10
£00.95 £12.55
£19.80. £11.90
£18.45 £11.05
£17.10 £10.25
£15.75 £ 9.45
£14.20 £ 8.50
£12.40 £ 7.45

"



L

FOURTH SCHEDULE

FIRST SCHEDULE

Regulation 4

Regulation nine

VWeekly rates of maternity zllowance in cases of
partial satisfaction of contribution conditions

Numbersincluding the

Weekly rate

number of reckonable .

contributions paid or Of maternity allow- Of increase in

credited in respect of ance without respect of adult

the relevant pexiod increase dependant
48-49 £18.60 £11.45
46-47 £17.85 £10.95

- 43-45 £16.90 £10.40

40-42 £15.75 £ 9.70
37-39 £14.60 £ 8.95
34~36 £13.45 £ 8.25
30-33% £12.10 £ 7.45
26-29 £10.55 £ 6.50

"



FIFTH SCHEDULE Regulation 5

SECOND SCHEDULE | Regulation thirteen

Reduced amount of death grant payable where contribution
conditions are not fully satisfied

() (2) (3) (4) - (5)
Yearly average of The age of the deceased at death
reckonable contri-

] + 3
ZEZéigzd?alu or Between Between
Over 18| 6 and 18 3 and 6 Under 3
Full amcunt of death grant payable under Part
III of the Social Insurance (Rates of Contri-
butions and Benefits, etc.) (Cuernsey) Ordinance, 1979
£65.00 £48.75 £32.50 £12.50
Reduced amount of death grant payable
30-44 £48.75 | £36.55 £24.40 £14.65
10-29 £32.50 £24.40 £16.25 £9.75

1



SIXTH SCHEDULE Regulation 6
SECOND SCHEDULE ' Regulation seven

Rates of increase of industrial disablement benefit under
section fifty of the Law where constant attendance is required

Description of case : Rate of increase

(1) (2)

1. Vhere beneficiary is dependent 1. £10
to & substantizl extent on

constant attendance

2. Vhere beneficiary is depsndent 2. £15
to a substantial extent con
congtant attendance and wher
attendance required is greater
by xeason of exceptionally

severe disablement

3. Vhere beneficiary is entirely 3. £20
or almost entirely dependent

on constant attendance

11



EXPLAWATORY NOTE

(This Note is not part of the Regulations, but is
intended to indicate their general purport.)

These regulations increase the reduced rates of widow's benefits, old
age pension, ﬁhémployment benefit, sickness benefit, invalidity benefit
and maternity allowance payable under the Social Insurance (Guernsey) Law,
1978, in order to bring them into correspondence with the higher standard
rates of such benefits approved by the States on the 27th June, 1979
(regulations two, three and four); increase the reduced amounts of death
grant payable under that law in order %o bring them into correspondence
with the higher stendard amount of death grant approved by the States
as aforesaid (regulation five); and revise the rates of increase of
industrial disablement benefit where constant attendance is required
(regulation six). The remaining provisions of these regulations effect

minor consequential and other amendments.





