GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

1986 - No.Z¥

The Post Office {Inland Post) (Amendment) (No. 2) Order, 1986

Made “an

Laid before the States ...

Coming into Operation ... 3rd November 1986

THE STATES POST QFFICE BOARD, in pursuance of the powers
conferred upon it by sections 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 20, 23, 28 and

68 of the Post Office (Guernsey) Law, 1969, as amended (a),

hereby orders:-

Amendments to 1, The Post Office {(Inland Post) Order, 1983, as amended (b),
Inland Post
Or " of 1983. is hereby further amended as follows:-

{a) in Section 16 (2) thereof for the words
“fifty-five new pence" there is substituted "£1.00";
(b) in Section 30 (2) thereof for the words "ten pounds"
there is substituted "£20";
(c) in Section 38 thereof for the words "eighteen
pounds" there is substituted "£20";
(d) in Section 44 thereof -
(i} in subsection (1), for "£18" there is
substituted "£20";
(ii) in subsection (2} the words "caused either by
physical means or through deterioration”
are repealed;
{e) in the Third Schedule in paragraph 4 (b) thereto after

the word "Jersey" there is inserted the words "Republic

of Ireland";
{a) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXII, p.128; Vol. XXIII, p.511.
{b) S.I. 1983 No, 9; S.I. 1984 No. 15; S.I. 1984 No. 24;

S.I. 1985 No. 4; 8.I. 1985 No. 12; S.I. 1986 No. 10



(f} in Section 51 subsections {2) - (9) inclusive
are repealed;

(g} Part I of the Fifth Schedule thereto is repealed
and the Part set out in the First Schedule to this
Order is substituted therefor;

{h) Part I of the Sixth Schedule thereto is repealed
and the Part set out in the Second Scheule to this
Order is substituted therefor;

(i) the First, Second, Seventh and Eighth Schedules
thereto are repealed and the Schedules set out in
the Third and Fourth Schedules to this Order are
respectively substituted therefor.

Citation. 2. This Order may be cited as the Post Office {Inland Post)
{Amendment) No. 2)Order, 1986.

Commencement . 3. This Order shall come into force on the 3rd day of November,

1986.
Ry

President of the States Post Office Board

, 1986.

R. A. PERROT

for and on behalf of the Board



FIRST SCHEDULE Section {g)

" FIFTH SCHEDULE Sections 27, 28,

30 and 31

Registered postal packets

PART I

Regigtration fees and maximum compensation

Col. 1
Registration fee
(in addition to postage)

Col. 2
Maximum compensation
{(payable according to fee paid or

charged)
£ £
1.20 650
(minimum registration fee)
1.35 1350
1.50 1850




SECOND SCHEDULE Section (h)

" STXTE SCHEDULE Sections 32, 33 and 34

Compensation fee parcel service scheme

PART T

Parcel compensgsation fee and maximum compensation

Col. 1 Col. 2
Compensation fee Maximum compensation
(in addition to postage) {payable according to fee paid or
charged)
S £
0.30 ‘ 60
0.40 125
0.60 225
0.75 350




n THIRD SCHEDULE Section 1 (i)

FIRST SCHEDULE Sections 1, 19, 22,
49 and 51

Rates of postage on poétal packets

Col. 1 Col. 2
Description of Rates of postage
postal packet

1. Letter, other than | (i) If transmitted as a local letter:-

a flowerbox Weight not exceeding 100 g. ... 10p
thereafter,
not exceeding 150 g. e e 15p
" " 200 g. e e 19p
" " 250 g. e e 24p
" " 300 g. e e 30p
n n 350 g. 36p
" " 400 g. Lop
b N 5o g. 4hy
t n 500 g. 50p
n 1 750 2. . .. 'TLLp
" " 1000 g. v+ ... 100p

and thereafter, for each
additional 250 g. or
part thereof cen eee e.. 2bp

(1i) If transmitted as a letter tec the
United Kingdom, the Isle of Man,
or Jersey:-

Weight not exceeding 60 g. ... 1bkp
thereafter,

not exceeding 100 g. . i8p

u " 150 g. . 22p

" " 200 g. . 28p

" 1 250 g. SBP

1 1t 300 g. 39p

1 1t 350 g. i u_up

; 1 1 oo 2. 50p

1t " 450 g. .. BSP

" " 500 g. 61p

" b 550 £. 66p

" " 600 g. Tip

] 1t 650 E- 78p

] 1) 700 g. R 83p

" 1 750 g. ng

" " 800 g. - a8p

" " 850 g. ... 107p

b " 900 g. ves ... 117p

. L 950 g. ... ... 127p

" " 1000 g. ... ... 136p

and thereafter, for each
adgitional 250 g. or
part thereof cee e e 38




Col. 1
Description of
postal packet

Col. 2

Rates of postage

2. Newspapers

3. Articles for the
use of the blind

%}, Business reply
packet

5. Parcel
(a) United Kingdom
Isle of Man

(b) Jersey
Republic of
Ireland

(¢) Local

(a)
{b)

Weight not exceeding 100 g.

thereafter,

not exceeding 150
1" 1] ZOO
1 n 250
1t 1" 300

i " 350
1 n LI'OO

n n 450
n 1" 500
L tf 750

No rate specified.

o 09 0g 09 03 09 0} 93 OR

The appropriate rate in

Item 1 plus

An annual fee of £15.

Weight not exceedi
thereaflter,

not exceeding
1 u

W e~ v FEw N

=
o

1t t 12%
L " 15
" n 1‘7%
" L 20
" L 22%
L " 25

Weight not exceedi
thereafter,

not exceeding
1t "

2

3

4

5

6

11 " ?
8

9

10

Weight not exceedi
thereafter,

not exceeding 2
A1) "

3
" L 4
5

.o

ng

kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
keg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.
kg.

ng

ng

kg,
kg.
ké.
kg.

1 kg.

1 kg.

1 kg.

10p

15p
19p
2ip
30p
36p
40p
hltp
50p
Thp

£1.

£1.
£2.
£2.
£2.
£2.
£3.
£3.
£3.
£3.
£5.
£6.
£7.
£8.
. £9.
.. £10.

£1.

£1.
£2.
£2.
£2.
£2.
£3.
£3.
£3.
£3.

£0.
£1.

£,
.60

£1

£1.

.5p

95

20
50

70



Col. 1
Description of
postal packet

Rates of postage

Col. 2

(c) Parcel
Local
{ continued)

6. Flower box

Box

oo Qm e

not exceeding 6

tt "

Dimensions not exceeding

Length
400 mm.
450 mm.
560 mm.
580 mm.
610 mm.

7
8

9
10
123
15
172
20
22%
25

Gir
330
420
360
515
600

keg.
kg.
kg.
kg.

th

mm.
mm.
min.
mm.
M.

21.
£1.
£2.
£2.
£2.
£3.
£h.
£5.
£5.
26,
7.

£1.




" FOURTH SCHEDULE Section 1 (1)

SECOND SCHEDULE Sections 2, 11, 20,
22, 35 and 39

Postal facilities

1. Certificate of posting
2. Recorded delivery
3. Cash on delivery

4, Advice of delivery of, or inability to

deliver, a registered postal packet:-
(a} if requested at time of posting

{b) if requested after posting

5. Advice of delivery of, or inability to

deliver, a recorded delivery packet:-
(a) if requested at time of posting ...

(b) if requested after posting

6, Private Post Boxes. Collection by the

Board of postal packets (other than
parcels) posted in a private posting box
{provided by the person requesting the
facility) of a design and in a position
approved by the Board:-

{1} For initial period of one year or
less:~

(a) For one collection, on six or
fewer weekdays in every week

{b) Where the posting box is above
or below ground floor - for each
floor which the collector has to
ascend to make the collection

(c) Distance fee, payable where
collection, in the opinion of
the Board, involves travelling
in excess of the normal route
of the collecting officer

Free
22p

£1.00

21lp
b2p

21p
Uzp

£55.00

Such fee not exceed-
ing £20 as the Board
may fix, having
regard to the
facilities available
for ascent and
descent.

Such fee as the

Board may fix, having
regard to the cost

of the excess
travelling.



	page-0001.tif
	page-0002.tif
	page-0003.tif
	page-0004.tif
	page-0005.tif
	page-0006.tif
	page-0007.tif
	page-0008.tif

