
GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT 

1986 - No. Z? 

The Post Office (Inland Post) (Amendment) (No. 2) Order, 1986 

Made . . . 
Laid before the States ... 
Coming into Operation ... 3rd November 1986 

THE STATES POST OFFICE BOARD, in pursuance of the powers 

conferred upon it by sections 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 20, 23, 28 and 

68 of the Post Office (Guernsey) Law, 1969, as amended (a), 

hereby orders:- - 

Amendments to 1. The Post Office (Inland Post) Order, 1983, as amended (b) , 
Inland Post 
Or of 1983. is hereby further amended as follows:- 

(a) in Section 16 (2) thereof for the words 

"fifty-five new pence" there is substituted "£1.00"; 

(b) in Section 30 (2) thereof for the words "ten pounds" 

there is substituted "£20"; 

(c) in Section 38 thereof for the words "eighteen 

pounds" there is substituted "£20"; 

(d) in Section 44 thereof - 

(i) in subsection (I), for "£18" there is 

substituted "£20"; 

(ii) in subsection (2) the words "caused either by 

physical means or through deterioration" 

are repealed; 

(e) in the Third Schedule in paragraph 4 (b) thereto after 

the word "Jersey" there is inserted the words "Republic 

of Ireland"; 

(a) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXII, p.128; Vol. XXIII, p.511. 

(b) S.I. 1983 No. 9; S.I. 1984 No. 15; S.I. 1984 No. 24; 

S.I. 1985 No. 4; S.I. 1985 No. 12; S.I. 1986 No. 10 



(f) in Section 51 subsections ( 2 )  - ( 9 )  inclusive 

are repealed; 

( g )  Part I of the Fifth Schedule thereto is repealed 

and the Part set out in the First Schedule to this 

Order is substituted therefor; 

(h) Part I of the Sixth Schedule thereto is repealed 

and the Part set out in the Second Scheule to this 

Order is substituted therefor; 

(i) the First, Second, Seventh and Eighth Schedules 

thereto are repealed and the Schedules set out in 

the Third and Fourth Schedules to this Order are 

respectively substituted therefor. 

Citation. 2. This Order may be cited as the Post Office (Inland Post) 

(Amendment) (No. 2)0rder, 1986. 

commencement. 3. This Order shall come into force on the 3rd day of November, 

R. A .  PERROT 

for and on behalf of the Board 



FIRST SCHEDULE Sect ion  ( g )  

FIFTH SCHEDULE Sect ions  27, 28, 
30 and 31 

Registered p o s t a l  packets  

PART I 

Reg i s t r a t ion  f e e s  and maximum compensation 

(minimum r e g i s t r a t i o n  f e e )  
1.35 I 

Col. 1 
Reg i s t r a t ion  f e e  

( i n  addi t ion  t o  postage)  

Col. 2 
Maximum compensation 

(payable according t o  f e e  paid o r  
charged) 



SECOND SCHEDULE Section (h) 

SIXTH SCHEDULE Sections 32, 33 and 34 

Compensation fee parcel service scheme 

PART I 

Parcel compensation fee and maximum compensation 

Col. 1 
Compensation fee 

(in addition to postage) 

Col. 2 
Maximum compensation 

(payable according to fee paid or 
charged) 



THIRD SCHEDULE Sect ion  1 (i) 

FIRST SCHEDULE Sect ions  1. 19.  22. 
49 and 51 

Rates of postage on p o s t a l  packets  

Col . 1 
Descript ion of 
p o s t a l  packet 

. . . .  not  exceeding 150 g  
2 0 0 g  . . . .  

11 250 g  . . . .  
3 0 0 g  ... 
350 g  . . . .  
4 0 0 g  . . . .  
4 5 0 g  . . . .  
5 0 0 9  . . . .  
7 5 0 g  . . . .  

" 1 o o o g  . . . .  
and t h e r e a f t e r ,  f o r  each 
a d d i t i o n a l  250 g . o r  
p a r t  thereof  . . . . . .  

Col . 2 
Rates of postage 

1 . L e t t e r .  o t h e r  than 
a  flowerbox 

ii) I f  t r ansmi t t ed  a s  a  l e t t e r  t o  t h e  
United Kingdom. t h e  I s l e  of Man. 
o r  Jersey:-  

. . . .  Weight not  exceeding 60 g 14p 
t h e r e a f t e r .  

. . . . . . .  not  exceeding 100 g  18p 
150 g  . . . . . . .  22p 

. . . . . . .  200 g  28p 
250 g  . . . . . . .  33p 
300 g  . . . . . . .  39p 
350 g  . . . . . . .  44p 

. . . . . . .  400 g  50p , 450 g  . . . . . . .  55p 

. . . . . . .  500 g  61p 

. . . . . . .  550 g  66p 

. . . . . . .  600 g  71p 

. . . . . . .  650 g  78p 

. . . . . . .  700 g  83p 
750 g  . . . . . . .  89p 

. . . . . . .  800 g  98p 
11 . . . . . . .  850 g  l07p 

. . . . . . .  900 g  117p 

. . . . . . .  950 g  127p 

. . . . . . .  " 1000 g  136p 
and t h e r e a f t e r .  f o r  each 
a d d i t i o n a l  250 g  . o r  

. . . . . . . . .  p a r t  thereof  38p 

( i)  I f  t r ansmi t t ed  a s  a  l o c a l  l e t t e r : -  
. . . .  Weight not  exceeding 100 g  lop  

t h e r e a f t e r  . 



Col . 1 
Descript ion of 
p o s t a l  packet 

2 . Newspapers 

3 . A r t i c l e s  f o r  t h e  
use of t h e  b l ind  

4 . Business r ep ly  
packet 

5 . Parce l  
( a )  United Kingdom 

I s l e  of Man 

( b )  Jersey  
Republic of 

I r e l a n d  

( c )  Local 

Rates of postage 

Weight not  exceeding 100 g . 
t h e r e a f t e r .  
not  exceeding 150 g . . . .  

200 g . . . .  
250 g . . . .  
3 0 0 g  . . . .  
3 5 0 9  . . . .  
4 0 0 g  . . . .  
4 5 0 g  . . . .  
5 0 0 9  . . . .  
750 g . . . .  

No r a t e  s p e c i f i e d  . 

( a )  The appropr ia te  r a t e  i n  
Item 1 p lus  . . . . . . . . .  0 . 5 ~  

( b )  An annual f e e  of £15 . 

Weight not  exceeding 1 
t h e r e a f t e r .  
not  exceeding 2 kg . 

3 kg . 
4 kg . 
5 kg . 
6 kg . 
7 kg . 
8 kg . 
9 kg . 

10 kg . 
12: kg . 
15 kg . 
174 kg . 
20 kg . 
22; kg . 
25 kg . 

Weight not  exceeding 1 kg . 
t h e r e a f t e r  . 

. . . .  not  exceeding 2 kg 
3 kg . . . .  .. . 4 kg . . . .  

. . . .  Weight not  exceeding 1 kg 
t h e r e a f t e r .  

. . . . . . .  not  exceeding 2 kg 
3 kg . . . . . . . .  
4 kg . . . . . . .  
5 kg . . . . . . .  



Col . 1 
Descript ion of 
p o s t a l  packet 

( c )  Parce l  
Local 
(cont inued)  

6 . Flower box 

Box A 
B 
C 
D 
E 

Col . 2 
Rates of postage 

not  exceeding 6 kg . 
7 kg . 
8 kg . 
9 kg . 

10 kg . 
12;- kg . 
15 kg . 
173 kg . , 20 kg . 
22 1. kg . 
25 kg . 

Dimensions not  exceeding 

Length G i r t h  
400 mm . 330 mm . . . . . . .  2 9 ~  
450 mm . 420 nun . . . . . . .  6 5 ~  
560 mm . 360 . . . . . . .  7 7 ~  
580 mm . 515 mm . . . . . . .  9 5 ~  

. . . . . . .  610 mm . 600 mm £1.10 



FOURTH SCHEDULE Sect ion  1 (i) 

SECOND SCHEDULE Sect ions  2 ,  11, 20, 
22, 35 and 39 

Pos ta l  f a c i l i t i e s  

... 1. C e r t i f i c a t e  of pos t ing  ... Free 

2. Recorded de l ive ry  ... ... 22p 

... 3 .  Cash on de l ive ry  ... £1.00 

4 .  Advice of de l ive ry  o f ,  o r  i n a b i l i t y  t o  
d e l i v e r ,  a  r e g i s t e r e d  p o s t a l  packet:-  

( a )  i f  requested a t  time of pos t ing  . . .  21p 

... ( b )  i f  requested a f t e r  pos t ing  4 2 ~  

5. Advice of de l ive ry  o f ,  o r  i n a b i l i t y  t o  
d e l i v e r ,  a  recorded de l ive ry  packet :-  

( a )  i f  requested a t  time of pos t ing  ... 2 lp  

... ( b )  i f  requested a f t e r  pos t ing  42p 

6. P r iva te  Post  Boxes. Col lec t ion  by t h e  
Board of p o s t a l  packets  ( o t h e r  than 
p a r c e l s )  posted i n  a  p r i v a t e  pos t ing  box 
( ~ r o v i d e d  by t h e  person r eques t ing  t h e  
f a c i l i t y )  of a  design and i n  a  p o s i t i o n  
approved by t h e  Board:- 

(1) For i n i t i a l  period of one year  o r  
l e s s :  - 
( a )  For one c o l l e c t i o n ,  on s i x  o r  

fewer weekdays i n  every week 

( b )  Where t h e  pos t ing  box i s  above 
o r  below ground f l o o r  - f o r  each 
f l o o r  which t h e  c o l l e c t o r  has t o  
ascend t o  make t h e  c o l l e c t i o n  Such f e e  not  exceed- 

i n g  £20 a s  t h e  Board 
may f i x ,  having 
r ega rd  t o  t h e  
f a c i l i t i e s  ava i l ab le  
f o r  ascent  and 
descent .  

( c )  Distance f e e ,  payable where 
c o l l e c t i o n ,  i n  t h e  opinion of 
t h e  Board, involves t r a v e l l i n g  
i n  excess of t h e  normal r o u t e  
of t h e  c o l l e c t i n g  o f f i c e r  Such f e e  a s  t h e  

Board may f i x ,  having 
r ega rd  t o  t h e  cos t  
of t h e  excess 
t r a v e l l i n g .  


	page-0001.tif
	page-0002.tif
	page-0003.tif
	page-0004.tif
	page-0005.tif
	page-0006.tif
	page-0007.tif
	page-0008.tif

