
G U E R N S E Y  S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T  

1999 No. 50 

The Social Insurance (Increase of Benefits) Regulations, 1999 

Made . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  2nd December, 1999 

Laid before the States . . . . . .  

Coming into operation ...... 3rd January, 2000 

THE GUERNSEY SOCIAL SECURITY AUTHORITY, in exercise of the 
powers conferred upon it by sections 50 and 116 of the Social Insurance (Guernsey) 
Law, 1978, as amendeda, hereby orders:- 

Interpretation 

1. (1) Any reference in these Regulations to an enactment or 
regulations is (unless the context excludes) a reference thereto as 
amended, re-enacted, extended or applied. 

(2) The Interpretation (Guernsey) Law, 1948~  applies to the 
interpretation of these Regulations as it applies to the interpretation 
of a Guernsey enactment. 

Amendment 

2. For the second schedule to the Social Insurance (Industrial Injuries 
Benefits) (Guernsey) Regulations, 1978' substitute the first schedule to these 
Regulations. 

Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXVI, p. 292; Vol. XXVII, pp. 238,307 and 392; Val. XXIX, pp. 24, 
148 and 422; No. V of 1990; Nos. V and XI1 of 1993; Ordinance No. XIV of 1993; Ordres en Conseil 
No. V of 1994, Nos. VI and XI11 of 1995; No. I of 1998; No. VI of 1999. 
b Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIII, p.355. 

S.I. 1978 No. 31; S.I. 1997 No. 33. 



3. In the Social Insurance (Benefits) (Transitional Provisions) (Guernsey) 
Regulations, 1 978d - 

(a) in regulation 19(2)(a) for "£34.00" substitute "£35.00"; 

(b) in regulation 19(2)(b) for "£50.75" substitute "£52.25". 

Repeal 
4. The Social Insurance (Increase of Benefit) Regulations, 1998' are 

repealed. 

Citation 

5. These regulations may be cited as The Social Insurance (Increase of 
Benefit) Regulations, 1999. 

Commencement 

6 .  These regulations shall come into force on 3rd January, 2000. 

Dated this 2nd day of December, 1999. 

0 D Le Tissier 

President of the Guernsey Social Security Authority, 
for and on behalf of the Authority. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Note is not part of the Regulations, but is intended to indicate their general purport.) 

These regulations increase the remaining benefits in line with the general increase in 
benefit rates approved by the States on 29th September, 1999. 

d S.I. 1978 No. 30; S.I. 1979 No. 13; S.I. 1981 No. 25; S.I. 1991 No. 29; S.I. 1997 No. 33 
S.I. 1998 -No. 28 



First Schedule 
"SECOND SCHEDULE Regulation 7 

Rates of increase of industrial disablement benefit under section 50 of the Law 
where constant attendance is required 

Description of case I Rate of increase 

1. Where beneficiary is dependent to a substantial extent on constant 
attendance 

£42.00 

2. Where beneficiary is dependent to a substantial extent on constant 
attendance and where attendance required is greater by reason of 
exceptionally severe disablement 

I 
£63.00 

3. Where beneficiary is entirely or almost entirely dependent on constant 
attendance 

£84.00 




	page-0001.tif
	page-0002.tif
	page-0003.tif
	page-0004.tif

