
Amendments 
to Overseas 
Letter Post 
Order of 1993. 

GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT 

1994 - No. 

The Post Office (Overseas Letter Post\ (Amendment) (No. 2) Order. 1994 

Made . . . ... ... ZI). August, 1994 

Laid before the States . . . 

Coming into Operation . . . 8th August, 1994 

THE STATES POST OFFICE BOARD, in exercise of the powers 

conferred on it by sections 13, 14, 16 and 68 of the Post Office (Guernsey) 

Law, 1969, as amended (a), hereby orders:- 

1. In the Post Office (Overseas Letter Post) Order, 1993: 

(a) in the Arrangement of Sections, part HI, section 25 for the 

entry "Registration", substitute "Recorded Delivery"; 

(b) in the Arrangement of Sections, part HI, section 26 for the 

entry "Compensation for registered packets", substitute 

"Compensation for recorded packets"; 

(c) in the Arrangement of Sections, part III, section 27 for the 

entry "Compulsory registration and insurance", substitute 

"Compulsory recorded delivery and registration"; 

(d) in the Arrangement of Sections, part III, section 28 for the 

entry "Insured Letters", substitute "Registered Letters"; 

(e) in the Arrangement of Sections, part HI, section 29 for the 

entry "Compensation for insured letters", substitute 

"Compensation for registered letters"; 

(f) in the Arrangement of Sections, part HI, section 30 for the 

entry "Compensation for unregistered packets", substitute 

"Compensation for unrecorded packets"; 

(g) in section 25, for the heading "Registration" substitute 

"Recorded Delivery" ; 

(a) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXU, p.128; Vol. XXIII, p.511; Vol. X X W ,  p.5; 
NO. x of 1988; NO. m of 1990. 

(b) S.I. 1993 No. 5; S.I. 1994 No. 3. 



in section 26, for the heading "Compensation for registered 

packets" substitute "Compensation for recorded packets"; 

in section 27, for the heading "Compulsory registration and 

insurance" substitute "Compulsory recorded delivery and 

registration"; 

in section 28, for the heading "Insured Letters" substitute 

"Registered Letters" ; 

in section 29, for the heading "Compensation for insured 

letters" substitute "Compensation for registered letters"; 

in section 30, for the heading "Compensation for unregistered 

packets" substitute "Compensation for unrecorded packets"; 

in sections 10 (2) @), 25 (I), 27 (I), 27 (1) (a), 27 (2) and 

28 (1) (a), for "registered" substitute "recorded"; 

in sections 11 (4), 27 (1) (a), 27 (1) (b), 27 (2), 29 (1) (b) and 

33 (7) (b), for "registration fee" substitute "recorded delivery 

fee"; 

in sections 11 (4), 30 (a), 30 (b) and 31, for "unregistered 

postal packet" substitute "unrecorded postal packet"; 

in sections 12 (I), 12 (4) (a), 12 (4) @), 12 (5) (a), 12 (5) (b), 

25 (3), 26 (a), 26 (b), 31 and 32 (I), for "registered postal 

packet" substitute "recorded postal packet"; 

in sections 25 (2), 25 (2) @), 25 (2) (c) and 25 (2) (d), for 

"registration" substitute "recorded delivery"; 

in section 27 (2), for "unregistered" substitute "unrecorded"; 

in sections 33 (3) and 33 (7) (a), for "registered packet" 

substitute "recorded packet"; 

in section 35, for "unregistered postal packets" substitute 

"unrecorded postal packets"; 



(u) insections6(3), 12(!), 12(4)(a), 12(4)@), 12(5)(a), 

12 (5) @), 26 (b), 29 (I), 29 (2), 31 and 33 (3), for "an 

insured letter" substitute "a registered letter"; 

(v) in section 6 (3), for "uninsured registered letter", substitute 

"unregistered recorded letter"; 

(w) in section 27 (2), for "insured" substitute "registered"; 

(x) in section 28 (I), for "insured letters" substitute "registered 

letters"; 

(y) in sections 28 (1) (a), 28 (2), 29 (1) (a), 29 (1) (b), 33 (4), 

33 (5) and 40, for "insured letter" substitute "registered 

letter" ; 

(z) in section 23, for "£1.95" substitute "£2.70"; 

(al) in section 25 (2) (c), for "£1.90" substitute "£2.50"; 

@I) in section 28 (1) (d), for "£1500" substitute "£1000"; 

(cl) for Schedule 6, substitute the Schedule to this Order. 

Citation. 2. This Order may be cited as the Post Office. (Overseas Letter Post) 

(Amendment) (No. 2) Order, 1994. 

Commencement. 3. This Order shall come into force on 8th August, 1994. 

Dated this .day of August, 1994. 
A 

M. W. Torode 
President of the States Post Office Board 

for and on behalf of the Board 



SCHEDULE 

SCHEDULE 6 Sections 28 
and 2 9 .  

Reqistered Letters - Com~ensation fees and 
maximum com~ensation 

Compensation fees 

f 
3.00 
4.00 

Maximum compensation 

f 
500 
1000 

I 


	page-0001.tif
	page-0002.tif
	page-0003.tif
	page-0004.tif

