g

Island of ' Guernsey

Ordinance of the States

XXVII
2011
MAdEC...cuuerirrrrissnissnisssnssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssssassssassss 28th September, 2011
Coming into OPeration ...........cceeecssencsssncsssrcsssscsssssssasesasesens 1st January, 2012
The Dog Tax (Amendment)

(Guernsey) Ordinance, 2011



The Dog Tax (Amendment) (Guernsey) Ordinance, 2011

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 30" June, 20103,

and in exercise of the powers conferred on them by section 1 of the Dog Licences

(Guernsey) Law, 1969b, and of the powers conferred on them by section 1 of that

Law, as modified by the Alderney (Application of Legislation) (Dog Licences)

Ordinance, 1969°, hereby order:-

Amendment of the 1990 Ordinance.

1. The Dog Tax (Guernsey) Ordinance, 19904 ("the 1990 Ordinance")

is amended as follows -
(a) in section 1(1), for "£5" substitute "£10", and
(b) in section 1(2), for "£2.50" substitute "£5".

Amendment to have effect in Alderney.

2. The amendments to the 1990 Ordinance made by section 1 shall have

effect in the Island of Alderney as they have effect in the Island of Guernsey.

Citation.
3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Dog Tax (Amendment)
(Guernsey) Ordinance, 2011.

2 Article III of Billet d'Etat No. XV of 2010.
Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXII, p. 296.
Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XVI, p. 202.
Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXV, p. 155.



Commencement.

4. This Ordinance shall come into force on the 1* January, 2012.

S.M.D. ROSS,
Her Majesty's Deputy Greffier.



Copies may be purchased from
Her Majesty’s Greffier, Royal Court House, Guernsey.

PRICE £1.00
Printed by Image Group, Caslon Court, Pitronnerie Road, St Peter Port, Guernsey GY1 3NE





