
 

Ordinance No. XXXVI of 1998 

© States of Guernsey 
 

 

The Gambling (Betting) (Amendment) Ordinance, 1998 

 

 THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 28th day of 

October, 1998
a
, and in exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the 

Gambling (Guernsey) Law, 1971, as amended
b
, hereby order:-    

 

Amendments to Ordinance of 1973. 

 1. The Gambling (Betting) Ordinance, 1973, as amended
c
, is further 

amended as follows- 

 

   (a) in section 27, for "£26" substitute "£32"; 

 

   (b) in section 28(1)(a), for "£650" substitute "£800"; 

 

(c) in section 28(1)(b), for "£1,300" substitute 

"£1,600"; 

 

   (d) in section 28(1)(c), for "£325" substitute "£400"; 

 

(e) in paragraph 2 of the Second Schedule, for "£33" 

substitute "£40"; and 

__________________________________________________________________ 
a  Article X of Billet d'État No. XXII of 1998. 
b  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXIII, p. 109; Vol. XXIV, p. 400; and No. 

XXVII of 1997. 
c  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XIX, p. 147; Tome XX, p. 67; Tome 

XXI, p. 95; Tome XXV, p. 127; and Tome XXVI, pp. 348 and 429. 
  

 



 

© States of Guernsey 
 

 

(f) in paragraph 2(a) of the Third Schedule, for "£33" 

substitute "£40". 

 

Repeal. 

 2. Section 1(3) of the Gambling (Fees) (Amendment) Ordinance, 

1994
d
 is hereby repealed.  

 

Citation. 

 3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Gambling (Betting) 

(Amendment) Ordinance, 1998. 

 

__________________________________________________________________ 
d  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXVI, p. 348. 

 


