Island of Guernsey

Ordinance of the States XXXVII

1994
Made 14th December, 1994,
Came into operation ... ... ... ... ... 14th December, 1994.

The Gambling (Fees) (Amendment) Ordinance, 1994

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 28th September, 1994(a),
and in exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the Gambling (Guernsey) Law,
1971, as amended(b), hereby order:-

Increase in gambling fees. _
1- (1) In paragraph 16 of the Schedule to the Gambling (Cinema Racing)
Ordinance, 1988(c) for "£30" substitute "£40"

(2) In section 14(1) and (2) of the Gambling (Crowxi and Anchor)
(Guernsey) Ordinance, 1983, as amended(d), for "forty pounds" substitute "£50".

(@  Article XXI of Billet d’Etat No. XVII of 1994.
(b)  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXIII, p. 109; and Vol. XXIV, p. 400.
(©  Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome XXIV, p. 454.

(d Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome XXII, p. 457; and No. IV of 1990.



2

(3 Inthe Gambling (Betting) Ordinance, 1973, as amended(e)-

(@)

(b)

©

@

(e)

®

Repeals.

in section 27 for "£20" substitute "£26";

in section 28(1)(a) for "£500" substitute "£650";

in section 28(1)(b) for "£€1,000" substitute "£1,300";

in section 28(1)(c) for "£250" substitute "£325%

in paragraph 2 of the Second Schedule for "£25" substitute
I|£33|';

in paragraph 2(a) of the Third Schedule for "£25" substitute
"£33".

2. The Gambling (Crown and Anchor) (Guernsey) (Amendment) Ordinance,
1990(f) and the Gambling (Betting) (Amendment) Ordinance, 1989(g) are repealed.

Citation.

3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Gambling (Fees) (Amendment)

Ordinance, 1994.

K. H. TOUGH,
Her Majesty’s Greffier.

(¢)  Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome XIX, p. 147; Tome XX, p. 67; Tome XXI, p. 95; and

No. XXXITI of 1989.

()  Ordinance No. IV of 1990.

(®  Ordinance No. XXXII of 1989.

Copies may be purchased from

Her Majesty’s Greffier, Royal Court House, Guernsey.

PRICE 25p



