No. XVIII of 1999

The Gambling (Gaming and Lotteries) (Amendment)

Ordinance, 1999

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 27th day of May,
1999?, and in exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the Gambling

(Guernsey) Law, 1971, as amendedb, hereby order:-

Amendments to Ordinance of 1991.

1. The Gambling (Gaming and Lotteries) Ordinance, 1991c, is amended

as follows-

(a)

(b)

©

(d

(e

®

in the proviso to section 6(1)-

@) for "£1" substitute "£5"; and

(i1) for "£8,000" substitute "£20,000";

in section 6(3)(c), immediately after "Class III" insert
"or Class IV";

in section 8(a), for "£800" substitute "£1,000";

in section 8(b), for "£4,000" substitute "£5,000";

in section 8(c), for "£8,000" substitute "£10,000";

immediately after section 8(c) insert a semi-colon and
the following paragraph-

a Article VI of Billet d'Etat No. XI of 1999.

b
of 1997.

Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXIII, p. 109; Vol. XXIV, p. 400; and No. XXVII

¢ Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXV, p. 348.



"(d) Class IV, being lotteries other than Classes
I, IT or III, where the price of a ticket or
chance is more than £1 and does not exceed
£5 and in which no prize exceeds £20,000 in

value";

(2) immediately after section 9(1)(c) insert a semi-colon and
the following paragraph-

"(d) for promoting a Class IV lottery, £100";
(h) in section 11(2)(b)-
@) for "50 pence" substitute "£1"; and
(ii) for "£80" substitute "£100".
Citation.

2.  This Ordinance may be cited as the Gambling (Gaming and Lotteries)
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1999.



