1]
1986
STATES OF ALDERNEY

-

ORDINANCE OF THE STATES

Made ..voeeieecieeiciie e 4" June, 1986
Coming intoforce ..........cccuuvene.n. 1% January, 1987

HE MOORING CHARGES (AMENDMENT) (ALDERNEY)
ORDINANCE, 1986

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 4" day of June,
1986 and in exercise of the powers conferred upon them by sections
1(1) and 2 of the Mooring Charges (Alderney) Law, 1976(a), hereby

~ order:-

" Amendments to Ordinances of 1980.

1. - In the Mooring Charges (Alderney) Ordinance, 1980, as
~ amended (b) -

(a) in section 3, for “three pounds” there is substituted “£4”;

(b) in section 4(a), for “€£100" is substituted “£150”;

(c) in section 4(b), for “£100" there is substituted “£150";

(d) for the Schedule there is substituted the Schedule to this
Ordinance.

- Interpretation.

2 The Interpretation (Guernsey) Law, 1948(c) applies to the
¢ interpretation of this Ordinance as it applies to the interpretation of an
enactment inforce in the Island of Alderney.

ze'Repeals.

3. The Mooring Charges (Amendment) (Alderney) Ordinance,

537’1984 and section 1(a) of the Mooring Charges (Amendment)
(Alderney) Ordinance, 1982 are repealed.

(a) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXVI, p.56
(b) Alderney Ordinances Nos. 109, 123 and 132
(c) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XiIl, p.355




Citation.

4, This Ordinance may be cited as the Mooring Charges
(Amendment) (Alderney) Ordinance, 1986.

Collective Title.

5. This Ordinance and the Mooring Charges (Aldemey)
Ordinances, 1980 and 1982 may be cited together as the Mooring
Charges (Alderney) Ordinances, 1980 and 1986.

Commencement.

6. This Ordinance shall come into force on the Ist day of
January, 1987.

SCHEDULE Section 1(d)
SCHEDULE Section 2

Mooring charges in Little Crabby Harbour and at any
place within 20 yards of any part of the Sapper Slipway

Classes of Boats Rates of mooring charges. for
each mooring charges year

Length overall of the boat,
including any fixed bowsprit,
pulpit, bumkin and davit:

Not exceeding 15 feet £30

Exceeding 15 feet £50




