GREFFE -
ROYAL COURT

GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT 2 8TAN 2009
209No. 3

| GUERNSEY |
The Births, Deaths and Marriage Certificates (Fees)

Regulations, 2009

Made Q}WM -, 2009

Coming into operation 1% February, 2009
Laid before the States , 2009

THE TREASURY AND RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, in exercise of the

powers conferred on it by sections 1 and S of the Fees, Charges and Penalties

(Guernéey) Law, 2007" and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes

the following regulations:-

Amendment of fees.

1. The Births, Deaths and Marriages Certificates (Miscellaneous

Provisions) (Guernsey) Law, 1951b ("the 1951 Law") is amended in accordance with

the provisions of these Regulations.

Fee for short form birth certificate.

2. In section 1(2) of the 1951 Law for "£10" substitute "£11.50".

Fee for full birtngeath and marriage certificates.
3. In sections 1(3), 2 and 3 of the 1951 Law for "£15" substitute
"£17.50".

Order in Council No. VII of 2008.

Ordres en Conseil Vol. XV, p.46; amended by Vol. XXVII, p.40 and Vol.
XXXIII p.444; Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome XXV, p.238; Ordinance XXII of
2006.

The amounts in the 1951 Law were amended by Ordinance XXII of 2006.

1




Repeal. _
4. Sections 1, 2 and 3 of the Births, Deaths and Marriage Certificates

(Fees) (Amendment) Ordinance, 2006d are repealed.

Citation,
5. These Regulations may be cited as the Births, Deaths and Marriage
Certificates (Fees), Regulations, 2009.

Commencement

6. These Regulations shall come into force on 1* February, 2009.

Dated this 21 oy Jiwerny, 2009

DEPUTY C. N. K. PARKINSON
Minister of the Treasury and Resources Department

For and on behalf of the Department

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the regulations)
These Regulations increase the fees payable for the issue of birth, death and marriage

certificates.

Ordinance XXII of 2006.




