
GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTXUMENT 

2010 No. 30 

ROYAL COURT 

The Customs and Excise 

(Bailiwick of Guernsey) (Personal Reliefs) (Amendment) 

Order, 2010 

Made 13 April, 201 0 

Corning into operation 14 April, 201 0 

THE HOME DEPARTMENT, in pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by 

sections 21 and 23G of the Customs and Excise (General Provisions) (Bailiwick of Guernsey) 

Law, 1972. and section 4(3) of the European Communities (Bailiwick of Guernsey) Law, 1973, 

and in implementation of the obligations of the Bailiwick under the provisions of Protocol No 3 

annexed to the Treaty relating to the accession of the United Kingdom to the European 

Economic Community and to the European Atomic Energy Community, hereby orders:- 

Amendment to the Schedule to tke Customs and Excise (Bailiwick of Guernsev) (Personal 

Reliefs) Order, 2008. 

1. Paragraph 3 of the Schedule to the Customs and Excise (Bailiwick of Guernsey) 
b 

(Personal Reliefs) Order, 2008 , is hereby amended as follows - 

(a) In paragraph 3(b) for "£340" substitute "£390"; and 

(b) In paragraph 3(c) for "£240" substitute "£270". 

a 
Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXIII, p. 573, as amended by Vol. XXXIII, p. 217; Order in 

Council No. X of 2004; Recueil DIOrdonnances Tome XXX, p. 7 18; Tome XXXI, p. 672; Tome 
XXXII, p. 607; Tome XXXII, p. 668; Ordinance No. LV of 2008; and No. XLIV of 2009. Also 
amended by the Machinery of Government (Transfer of Functions) (Guernsey) Ordinance, 2003 
(No. XXXIII). 

G.S.I. No. 63 of 2008. 



Interpretation. 

2. The Interpretation (Guernsey) Law, 1948' shall apply to the interpretation of this 

Order throughout the Bailiwick as it applies to the interpretation of an enactment. 

Citation and commencement. 

3. This Order may be cited as the Customs and Excise (Bailiwick of Guernsey) 

(Personal Reliefs) (Amendment) Order, 2010 and shall come into force on the 13th day of April, 

20 10. 

Dated this 13th day of April, 20 10 

DEPUTY G. H. MAHYp 

Minister of the Home Department 

For and on behalf of the Board 

C 
Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIII, p.355. 



EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This notice is notpurt of the Order btit is intended to indicate its generulptirpose and effect) 

This Order amends the monetary limits above which duty may be payable on goods other than 

alcohol and tobacco brought to the Island. The monetary limits for such goods imported by 

travellers from places outside the customs territory of the European Community are increased. 

The allowance applicable for travellers on commercial air or sea services is increased to £390, 

with private air and sea travellers qualifying for an increased allowance of £270. 




