
Ordinance of the Chief Pleas, 

entitled 

The Financial Provisions (Amendment) (Sarkl Ordinance. 2002 

THE CHIEF PLEAS OF SARK, in pursuance of their Resolution of the * , 3rd day of October 2001, and in exercise of the powers conferred upon them by - -- 
L b 

p sections 5, 12, 20 and 28 of the Financial Provisions (Sark) Law, 1978, as 
-, 

amended1 (hereinafter called "the principal Law"), hereby order:- 

Amendment to the princi~al Law 
1. The principal Law is hereby amended as follows:- 

(a) in the Third Schedule, for "£5" substitute "£15"; 

(b) in the Fowth Schedule, for "£3 " substitute "£5"; and 

(c) in the Fifth Schedule, for "£3" substitute "£5". 

Citation 
2. This Ordinance may be cited as the Financial Provisions (Amendment) 

(Sark) Ordinance, 2002. 

Commencement 
3. This Ordinance shall come into force on 16 January 2002. 

'Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXIV, p. 480; No. X of 19 9 1 . 


