A
i
el
N

(No. LIL—1990)
(Made on the 13th December, 1990.)

The Liquor Licensing (Amendment) (No. 2) Ordinance, 1990

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 26th day
of July, 1990(a), hereby order:—

Amendments to Ordinance of 1984

1. In the Liquor Licensing Ordinance, 1984(b), as amended(c) ,
is hereby further amended as follows— (S

(a) in section 128(1)(c) for “fifty pounds” substitute “£80”;

(a) On Article XVI of Billet d’Etat No. XV of 1990
(b) No. XXXIV of 1984, .
(c) No. XVII of 1985; No. XLV of 1985; No. I of 1989. ) '._‘"."

XXV—N



- 210 ORDINANCES

(b) in section 128(1)(d) for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;
(c) in section 128(2)(c) for “fifty pounds” substitute “£80;
(d) in section 128(2) paragraph “(b)” is renumbered “(d)”

and in that paragraph for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;
(e) in section 128(3)(a) for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;
(f) in section 128(3)(b) for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;
(g) in section 129(a) for “fifty pounds” substitute “£80”;
(h) in section 129(b) for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;

(i) in sections 130(c) and (d) for “ten pounds” substitute
_“£1657;

(j) in section 131 for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;
(k) in section 132 for “fifty pounds” substitute “£80”;
(1) in section 134 for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;
(m)in section 135 for “ten pounds” substitute “£16”;

(n) in section 137(a) and (b) for “twenty-five pounds”
substitute “£407;

(o) in section 142(1) for “five pounds” substitute “£8”;

(p) in section 142(2) for “one pound” substitute “£2” and
“five pounds” substitute “£8”;

(q) in the definition of “a meal” in section 158 for “one
pound” substitute “£3”.

Citation

2, This Ordinance may be cited as the Liquor Licensing
(Amendment) (No. 2) Ordinance, 1990.

Collective title

3. This Ordinance and the Liquor Licensing Ordinances, 1984
to 1990, may be cited together as the Liquor Licensing
Ordinances, 1984 to 1990.

Commencement

4, This Ordinance shall come into force on the 1st January,
1991.




