03 Y
AW "JA 6 _Il(-l_qlP

Draft ’ 3
Ordinance of the Chief Pleas o
entitled

The Liquor Licensing (Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 1994

THE CHIEF PLEAS OF SARK, in exercise of the powers conferred upon them
by sections 8 and 24 of the Reform (Sark) Law, 1951(a), as amended, and with the
approval of the Seigneur, hereby order:-

Amendment to General Provisions Ordinance.
1. In the Liquor Licensing (General Provisions) (Sark) Ordinance, 1979, as
amended(b)-

(@ in the arrangement of sections insert the following entry at the
appropriate place-

"22B. Conditions of exercise of Guest House Licence.";

(b)  after section 224 insert the following section-

"Conditions of exercise of Guest House Licence.
22B. (1) A person holding a guest house licence in respect of

any premises shall not sell or supply any intoxicating liquor or case or
permit any such liquor to be sold, supplied or consumed in the premises

except-

(a) to and by a resident of the premises or to and by the
guests of such a resident entertained by him at his
own expense; and

(@  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XV, p. 215; there are amendments not relevant to this
Ordinance,

(b)  Ordinance No. 57, amended by No.’s 62, 76B and 86.




(b) for consumption on the licensed premises.

@) A person shall not consume any intoxicating liquor in
any premises in respect of which there is a guest house licence except

in the circumstances specified in subsection ®.%

(@  in section 46(1) (@)@ and (b){i) for "fifty pounds" substitute "level 2 on
the Sark uniform scale”;

(d in section 46(1)(a)(i) and (b)(ii) for "one hundred pounds" substitute
"twice level 2 on the Sark uniform scale”;

(&)  in the First Schedule add the following entry at the appropriate place-

5. Guest House Licence.”;

(®  in the Second Schedule(c) in Part I ("Weekdays other than Sundays")
add the following entry-

5. Guest Summer None Midday to
House Licence. 3.30 p.m.
6.30 p.m. to

11.45 p.m.

Winter None Midday to
3.30 p.m.

6.30 p.m. to

11.45 p.m.

(©)  The Second Schedule was substituted by Ordinance No. 76B and amended by No.
86.




Amendment to Fees Ordinance.

Provided that during any of the aforesaid
permitted hours of the summer and winter
periods the intoxicating liquor shall be served

with a meal.";

(® in the said Second Schedule, in Part II ("Sundays") add the following

entry-

5. Guest

House Licence.

Midday to
3.30 p.m.
6.30 p.m. to
11.45 p.m.

Summer None

Midday to
3.30 p.m.
6.30 p.m. to
11.45 p.m.

Winter None

Provided that during any of the aforesaid
permitted hours of the summer and winter
periods the intoxicating liquor shall be served

with a meal.";

(h)  in Parts I and II of the said Second Schedule, for "2.30 p.m." wherever
appearing in paragraphs 1 and 4 substitute "3.30 p-m.".

2.

1979, as amended(d)-

@)

In section 1 of the Liquor Licensing (Fees) (No. 2) (Sark) Ordinance,

(@) initem 1, for "£1.50" substitute "£3.00";

Ordinance No. 59, amended by No. 76A.




(b)  initem 2, for "£18.00" substitute "£52.00"

() in item 3, for "£5.00" substitute "£25.00"

(@  initem 4, for "£15.00" substitute "£80.00";

(e) after item 4 add the following entry-

"5. Guest House Licence. £30.00.".

(2)  In sections 2 and 3 of the said Ordinance, for "one pound" substitute
'£3.00" and, in section 8, for "three pounds" substitute "£9.00".

Citation.
3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Liquor Licensing (Amendment) (Sark)
Ordinance, 1994.




