
Island of Guernsey 

Ordinance of the States xxxll 
1990 

Made ..................... 31st October, 1990. 
Came into Operation ............ 31st October, 1990. 

The Liquor Licensing (Amendment) 
Ordinance, 1990 

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 26th day 
of July, 1990(a), hereby order:- 

Amendment to Ordinance of 1984 

1. The Liquor Licensing Ordinance, 1984(b), as arnended(c) is 
hereby further amended as follows- 

(a) in section 133(1) for "fifty pounds" substitute "£80"; 

(b) in section 133(2) for "ten pounds" substitute"£ 16"; 

(c) in section 136 for "fifty pounds" substitute "£80". 

(a) on Article XVI of Billet d'Etat No. XV of 1990. 
(b) No. XXXIV of 1984. 
(c) No. XVII of 1985; No. XLV of 1985; No. 1 of 1989. 



Citation 

2. This Ordinance may be cited as the Liquor Licensing 
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1990. 

Collective title 

3. This Ordinance and the Liquor Licensing Ordinances, 
1984 to 1989, may be cited together as the Liquor Licensing 
Ordinances. 1984 to 1990. 

K. H. TOUGH, 
Her Majesty's Greffier 

Copies may be purchased from 
Her Majesty's Greffier, Royal Court House, Guernsey. 

PRICE 25p 


