ORDER IN COUNCIL

ratifying a Projet de Loi

ENTITLED

The Public Health and Related
Offences (Increase in Fines) (Guer-
nsey) Law, 1986

(Registered on the Records of the Island of Guernsey
on the 16th December, 1986.)

Printed by Guernsey Herald Ltd., Victoria Road, Guernsey.

XViIl
1986




ORDER IN COUNCIL

In tHE Rovar CourT oF THE IsLanD oF GUERNSEY

The 16th day of December, 1986 before Sir Charles
Frossard, Kt., Bailiff; present:—Donald Pescott
Plummer, Brian Ernest Herbert Joy, Esquires,
Charles Henry Hodder, Esquires, O.B.E.,
Herbert Nicolle Machon, James de Sausmarez
Carey, Stanley Walter John Jehan, Raymond
Arthur Heaume, Esquires and Mrs. Dorothy
Winifred Le Pelley, Jurats.

The Bailiff having this day placed before the
Court an Order of Her Majesty in Council dated
the 5th day of November, 1986, approving and
ratifying a Projet de ILoi entitled “The Public
Health and Related Offences (Increase in Fines)
(Guernsey) Law, 1986 ”, the Court, after the reading
of the said Order in Council and after having heard
Her Majesty’s Procureur thereon, ordered that the
said Order in Council be registered on the records of
this Island and that an extract of this present Act,
together with a copy of the said Order in Council,
be sent by Her Majesty’s Greflier to the Clerk of the
Court of Alderney, of which Order in Council the
tenor followeth:—



2

at the Court at Buckingham Palace
The 5th day of November 1986

PRESENT,

The Queen’'s Most Excellent Majesty
in Counil

WHEREAS there was this day read at the Board
a Report from the right Honourable the Lords of
the Committee of Council for the Affairs of Guern-
sey and Jersey dated the 23rd day of July 1986 in
the words following, viz.:—

“Your Majesty having been pleased, by Your
General Order of Reference of the 22nd day of
February 1952, to refer unto this Committee the
humble Petition of the States of the Island of
Guernsey, setting forth:—

‘1. That, in pursuance of their Resolution of
the 11th day of December 1985, the States of
Deliberation at a meeting held on the 30th day
of April 1986 approved a Bill or “Projet de
TLoi” entitled “The Public Health and Related
Offences (Increase in Fines) (Guernsey) Law,
19867, and requested the Bailiff to present a
most humble Petition to Your Majesty in
Council praying for Your Royal Sanction there-
to. 2. That the said Bill or “Projet de Loi”
is as set forth in the Schedule hereunto annexed.
And most humbly praying that Your Majesty
might be graciously pleased to grant Your Royal
Sanction to the Bill or “Projet de Loi” of the
States of Guernsey entitled “ The Public Health



3

and Related Offences (Increase in Fines) (Guern-
sey) Law, 1986”, and to order that the same
shall have force of law in the Islands of Guern-
sey, Alderney, Herm and Jethou.”

“Tur Lorps or Tae CoMMITTEE, in obedience
to Your Majesty’s said Order of Reference, have
taken the said Petition and the said Projet de
Loi into consideration and do this day agree
humbly to report, as their opinion, to Your
Majesty, that it may be advisable for Your
Majesty to comply with the prayer of the said
Petition and to approve of and ratify the said
Projet de Loi”

HER MAJESTY having taken the said Report
into consideration is pleased, by and with the advice
of Her Privy Council, to approve of and ratify the
said Projet de Loi, and to order, and it is hereby
ordered, that the same shall have the force of Law
within the Islands of Guernsey, Alderney, Herm
and Jethou.

AND HER MAJESTY doth hereby further direct
that this Order, and the said Projet de Loi (a copy
whereof is hereunto annexed), be entered upon the
Register of the Island of Guernsey and observed
accordingly.

AND the Lieutenant Governor and Commander-
in-Chief of the Island of Guernsey, the Bailiff and
Jurats, and all other Her Majesty’s Officers for the
time being in the said Island, and all other persons
whom it may concern, are to take notice and govern
themselves accordingly.

G. I. de Deney.






5
PROJET DE LOI

ENTITLED

The Public Health and Related Offences
(Increase in Fines) (Guernsey) Law, 1986

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution
of the 11th day of December 1985, have approved
the following provisions which, subject to the Sanc-
tion of Her Most Excellent Majesty in Council, shall
have force of law in the Islands of Guernsey, Alder-
ney, Herm and Jethou.

1. The enactments mentioned in the left hand Increases in
column of the Schedule to this Law are amended g:;’;‘m“m
as set out in the right hand column of that Schedule.

2. This Law may be cited as the Public Health Citation.
and Related Offences (Increase in Fines) (Guernsey)
Law, 1986.

3. This Law shall have effect in Guernsey, Alder- Extent.
ney, Herm and Jethou.



SCHEDULE

6

Section 1.

INCREASE IN MAXIMUM FINES

Enactment

Amendment

The Law entitled “Loi Relative
a la Santé Publique, 19347,
registered on I7th March
1934(a).

The Law entitled “ The Public |

Health (Vermin) (Guernsey)
Law, 19487, registered on 30th
October 1948(b).

The Law entitled “The Public

Health (Vessels and Aircraft) |

(Guernsey) Law, 1950 7,
registered on 12th August
1950(c).

The Food and Drugs (Guernsey)
Law, 1970(d).

In section 3(1), for “five pounds ”
substitute “ £50 ”;

in section 3(3), for “twenty
pounds” substitute “ £200”.

In section 1{2), for “five
pounds ” substitute “£50” and
for “forty shillings” substitute
3 £2() ”;

in section 12, for “five pounds”
substitute “ £50”.

In section 4, for “one hundred
pounds ” substitute “ £400” and
for “fifty pounds” substitute
€ £200 J,'

In section 5(3), for “fifty
pounds ” substitute “ £100” and
for “five hundred pounds” sub-
stitute “ £1,000”;
in section 17(5),
pounds ” substitute
in section 20(1),
pounds ” substitute
in section 21(1),
pounds ” substitute
in section 21(4),
hundred pounds”
I3 £200‘ ):;

for “ten
£“ £20 ,7;
for “ten
[ £20 ”;
for “fifty
(3 £1 00 ”;
for “one
substitute

(@) Ordres en Conseil Vol IX, p. 386; Vol. XIX, p. 214;
Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome IX, p. 280; Tome XIII,

. 264.

P
(b) Ordres en Conseil Vol, XIII, p. 367; Vol. XXII, p. 318;
Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome X, p. 11,

(¢) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIV,

p. 402.

(d) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXII, p. 412; Vol. XXV, p. 378;
Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome XXI, p. 75.



Enactment

Amendment

in section 24(2), for “ twenty
pounds ” substitute “ £40”;
in section 3I(5), for “one
hundred pounds” substitute
3 £200 ’,;
in section 34(1), for *twenty
pounds ” substitute “£40”;

in the proviso to section 34(1),
for “fifty pounds” substitute
13 £100 ”;
in section 34(3), for “twenty
pounds ” substitute “£40”;

in section 35, for “ one hundred
pounds ” substitute “£200” and
for “five pounds” substitute
3 £10 )’;

in section 50(3), for *twenty-
five pounds” substitute “£50”
and for “five pounds ” substitute
{1 £10 ,,;

in section 51(2), for “twenty
pounds” substitute “£40”.

K. H. TOUGH,

Her Majesty’s Greffier.



