
Guernsey 

Ordinance of the States X 
1986 

Made 
Came Into Operation ... 

30th April, 1986. 
30th April, 1986. 

The Public Health and Related Offences 
(Increase in Fines) Ordinance, 1986 

THE STATES, in pursmn:-e of their Resolution 
of the 11 th day of December I';, 85, on the repre­
sentations of the States Board of Health, in exercise 
of the powers now vested in them by sec;tion 4 of 
the Law entitled "Loi relative a la Sante Publique, 
1934 "(a), of the powers conferred upon them by 
section 1 of the Alderney (Application of Legisla­
tion) Law, 1948(b), and of all other powers enabling 
them in that behalf, hereby order:-

1. The enactments mentioned in the left hand Increases in 

column of the Schedule to this Ordinance are mfi aximum 
nes. 

amended as fet out in the right hand column of 
that Schedule. 

~. This Ordinance may be cited as the Public Citation. 

Health and Related Offences (Increase in Fines) 
Ordinance, 1986. 

3. This Ordinance shall have effect, to the extent Extent. 

that the enactments which it amends have effect, in 
Guernsey, AlderIley, Herm and Jethou. 

(d) Ordres en Conseil Vol. IX, p. 386. 
(b) Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIII, p. 448. 



2 

SCHEDULE Section 1. 

INCREASES IN MAXIMUM FINES 

Enactment 

The Ordinance entitled" Ordon­
nance relative a l'Enterrement 
des Corps de personnes l'etat 
desquels constitue un danger 
a la Sante Publique, et au 
transport de tels corps dans des 
eglises, chapelles ou autres 
lieux de culte" made per­
manent on 5th October 1931 (c). 

The Public Health Ordinance, 
1936(d). 

Amendment 

In Article 2, for " £5" substitute 
" £50"; 
in Article 3, for" [5" substitute 
"[50 ". 

In section 1 of Article II, for 
" Ten Pounds" substitute 
" [100"; 
in section 7 of Article III, for 
" £20" substitute " [200"; 
in section 8 of Article III, for 
"One hundred pounds" substi­
tute " [1,000"; 
in section IA(S) of Article IV, 
for " one hundred pounds" sub­
stitute "[200"; 
in section 2 of Article VII, for 
"five pounds" substitute" £25"; 
in sections 5, 6 and 7 of Article 
VIII, for "£10", wherever 
appearing, substitute" £100"; 
in section 2 of Article X, for 

(c) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome V, p. 355. 
(d) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, p. 316; Tome X, pp. 35 

and 61; Tome XIII, p. 264; Tome XV, pp. 239 and 387; 
Tome XIX, p. 91: section lA of Article IV was inserted 
by the Public Health (Amendment) Ordinance, 1968 
(Tome XV, p. 387); section 2 of Article VII was sub 
stituted by the Public Health (Amendment) Ordinance, 
1973 (Tome XIX, p. 91). 



3 

Enactment 

The Ordinance entitled" Ordon­
nance supplementaire ayant 
rapport aux Maladies Secretes 
(1935)" of 17th October 1936(e). 

The Ordinance entitled" Ordon­
nance relative a la Destruction 
de Rats, 1937" of 20th March 
1937(f). 

Amendment 

" £100" substitute "£1,000"; 
in section 4 of Article XI, for 
" £25" substitute "£250"; 
in sections 5 and 7 of Article 
XI, for" £10", wherever appear­
ing, substitute" £100"; 
in section 1 of Article XII, for 
" £5" substitute "£50"; 
in section 2 of Article XII, for 
" [10" substitute "[100". 

In Article 2, for "£I 0" substi­
tute " [100" and for" £20" sub­
stitute "£200". 

In Article II, for " Five Pounds" 
substitute "[50"; 
in section (2) of Article III, for 
" Ten Pounds" substitute 
" [100"; 
in section (4) of Article III, for 

"Ten Pounds" substitute" £100 " 
and for" Twenty Pounds" sub­
stitute "£200"; 
in section (2) of Article IV, for 
" Ten Pounds" substitute 
" £1 ~O'' ; 
in the Schedule, for" £10" sub­
stitute "£100". 

(e) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, p. 10 I. 
if) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome IX, p. 24. 



4 

Enactment Amendment 

The Ordinance entitled" Or don- In section 3, for" One hundred 
nance relative aux Maladies pounds" substitute" £1,000". 
Secretes, 1937" of 27th Novem-
ber 1937(g). 

The Ordinance entitled "Ordon- For "Ten Pounds" substitute 
nance relative aux Fosses "£100" and for "Twenty-five ~ 
d'Aisance (Puits-Perdus) et Pounds" substitute "£250". ( 
Latrines, 1940" of 31st August 
1940(h). 

The Ordinance entitled" Ordon­
nance ayant rapport aux 
MALADIES SECRETES 
(1942) of 7th November 1942(1)' 

The Ordinance entitled "The 
Clean Milk Ordinance, 1945" 
of 8th December 1945(j). 

The Ordinance entitled "The 
Ice Cream (Heat Treatment) 
Ordinance, 1947" of 12th July 
1947(k). 

The Ordinance entitled "The 
Penicillin and Allied Sub­
stances Ordinance, 1950" of 
5th April 1950(~. 

In section 6, for il One hundred 
pounds" substitute "£1,000 ". 

In Article 1(1), for "Twenty­
five pounds" substitute "£250" 
and for" One hundred pounds " 
substitute" [1,000". 

In Article 8, for "[20" sub­
stitute " [200" and for "£100" 
substitute" [1,000". 

In section 3(1), for "fifty 
pounds" substitute "£200". 

(g) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, p. 102. 
(h) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome IX, p. 143. 
(i) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, pp. 103 and 107. 
I.J) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome IX, p. 156; Tome X, p. 161. 
(k) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome IX, p. 198. 
(I) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome X, pp. ~ and 393. 



,I 

I 

I 
I 

5 

Enactment Amendment 

The Pharmacists, Poisons and I In section 7 (8), for "twenty 
Pharmacy Ordinance, 1970(m). pounds" substitute "[40" and 

for "five pounds" substitute 
" [10"; 

The Nurses (Use of 
Ordinance, 1 973(n). 

in section 39(3) and 39(4), for 
"fifty pounds ", wherever appear­
ing, substitute" £100 "; 
in section 41, for "one hundred 
pounds" substitute "£200 ". 

Title) I In sections 1 (I), 1 (2), (3) and 
2(1), for" ten pounds ", wherever 
appearing, substitute" £20" and 
for "fifty pounds ", wherever 
appearing, substitute" £100". 

K. H. TOUGH, 

Her Majesty's Greffier. 

(m) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XVI, p. 236; Tome XVII, 
p. 121; Tome XIX, pp. 73 and 195; Tome XX, p. 342; 
Tome XXI, p. 13; Ordinance No. XXV of 1982. 

(n) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XIX, p. 126. 


