
OF THE STATES 211 

(No. Ll1-1990) 

(Made on the 13th December, 1990.) 

The Public Transport (Fees) Ordinance, 1990 
THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution ofthe 10th day 

of October, 1990(a), hereby order:-

Provision of and increase in fees in the Public Transport 
Ordinance, 1986 

1. In the Public Transport Ordinance, 1986(b)-

(a) in section 12(1) for "ten pounds" substitute "£15"; 

(b) in section 12(2) for" two pounds" substitute" £5"; 

(c) in section 12(3) for "five pounds" substitute "£7.50"; 

(d) in section 14(3) for "one pound" substitute "£5.00"; 

(e) in section 15(3) for" fifty new pence" substitute 
"£3.00". 

(f) in section 42 add the following subsection-

" (6) A fee of £10.00 shall be payable forthwith to the 
States Treasurer in respect of an examination performed 
under subsection (1) and a fee of £5.00 shall be payable 
forthwith in respect of an examination under subsection 
(2).". 

Provision of and increase in fees in the Road Traffic (Permits to 
Drive Public Service Vehicles) Ordinance, 1986 

2. In the Road Traffic (Permits to Drive Public Service 
Vehicles) Ordinance, 1986(c)-

(a) for section 4(4) substitute-

" (4) The fee for a driving test under subsection (3) (a) (i) 
shall be £12 per test period and the fee for an Island 
knowledge test under subsection 3(a)(ii) shall be £10, 
both payable in advance to the States Treasurer."; 

(a) on Article XXII of Billet d'Etat No. XVII of 1990. 
(b) Ordinance No. III of 1986. 
(c) Ordinance No. IV of 1986. 

. ~I: 
.;,' 
, J 

" '"". 

i: 

": 
"':, 

"J 

. '. 
:; 

, ;1 

',: .. . , . 

~ .' '. 



212 

" 

ORDINANCES 

(b) in section 7 after the words "in respect of" where they 
first appear, insert "the application for a grant," and for 
"£1.25" substitute "£5.00"; 

(c) the Schedule is repealed and the following substituted-

SCHEDULE Section 7 

Fees payable in respect of the application for, or grant or renewal of 
a permit 

Citation 

To accompany application 

Grant of 4 year permit ... 

Renewal of 4 year permit 

£ 5 

£10 

£20 ". 

3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Public Transport (Fees) 
Ordinance, 1990. I 

I 

-411 


