
Island of I\\III~ W' Guernsey 

Ordinance of the States IXV 
1989 

Made ........ . 
Came Into Opefallon 

30th November, 1989. 
30th November, 1989. 

fte Refase Disposal (Amendment, 
Ordinance, 1989 

THE STATES, on the Representations of the 
States Island Police Committee, hereby order:-

l. In the Refuse Disposal Ordinance, 1959, as Amend· 
ments to 

amended( a)- Ordinance 
• of J959. 

(a) in section 2(1), for "level 1" substttute 
"level 3"; 

(b) in section 3(2), for "level 1" substitute 
"level 2"; 

(c) in section 4(3), for "level 1" substitute 
"level 4" and for "six months" substitute 
"three months"; 

(d) in section 5(2), for "level 1" substitute 
i'level 4" and for "six months" substitute 
"three months "; 

. (a) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome xn, p. 97 and Tome XIII, 
p. 290; Oidres en Conset1 No. V of 1989. 



Citation. 

Collective 
title. 

2 

(e) in section 6(4), for "level I" substiTUte 
"level 2". 

2. This Ordinance may be cited as the Re£u,'e 
Disposal (Amendment) Ordinance 1989. 

3. This Ordinance and the Refuse Disposal Ordi­
nances, 1959 and 1963 may be cited together as the 
Refuse Disposal Ordinances, 1959 to 1989. 

K. H. TOUGH, 

Her Majesty's Greffier. 

Copies may be purchased from 
Her Majesty's Greffier, Royal Court House, Guernsey. 

PRICE 20p 


