
 

© Chief Pleas of Sark 

ORDINANCE OF THE CHIEF PLEAS 

ENTITLED 

 

The Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages)  

(Amendment) (Sark) (No. 2) Ordinance, 2010 

 

 THE CHIEF PLEAS OF SARK, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 7th 

day of July, 2010 and in exercise of the powers conferred on them by section 37 of 

the Reform (Sark) Law, 2008
a
 and all other powers enabling them in that behalf, 

hereby order:- 

 

Amendment to Ordinance of 1967. 

1. Section 2A of the Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) 

(Sark) Ordinance 1967, as amended
b
, is further amended as follows - 

 

_____________________________________________________________________ 

a  Order in Council No. V of 2008; amended by No. VI of 2008 and No. 

XXVII of 2008. 
b  The Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) (Sark) Ordinance 1967, 

as amended by the Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) 

(Sark) Ordinance, 1970, the Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) 

(Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 1972, the Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid 

Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 1974, the Road Traffic (Tractors and 

Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 1980, the Road Traffic 

(Tractors and Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 1983, the Road 

Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 1988, the 

Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 2002 

and the Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) 

Ordinance, 2008; and the Road Traffic (Tractors and Invalid Carriages) 

(Amendment) (Sark) Ordinance, 2010. 

 



 

© Chief Pleas of Sark 

   (a) in subsection (3), for “£6” substitute “£20”, and 

 

   (b) in subsection (4), for “£3” substitute “£10”. 

 

Citation. 

 2. This Ordinance may be cited as the Road Traffic (Tractors and 

Invalid Carriages) (Amendment) (Sark) (No. 2) Ordinance, 2010. 

 

Commencement. 

 3. This Ordinance shall come into force on 1st January, 2011.  


