
Island of ~ Guernsey 
~ 

Ordinance of the States XlIII 
1984 

Made ... ... . .. 
Coming Into Operation 

28th November, 1984. 
1 st December, 1984. 

The Stray Dogs (Amendment) Ordinance, 
1984 

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution 
of the 26th day of September, 1984, hereby order:-

l. The Stray Dogs Ordinance, 1941, as amended(a), Amend. 
is hereby further amended as follows' men,ts to the . Orchnance 

(0) in section 1 (2)(a) thereof for the words 
" two pounds" there is substituted" £3.00 "; 

(b) in section 1 (2) (b) thereof for the words 
" three pounds" there is substituted 
" £5.00" and for the words "two pounds" 
there is substituted" £3.00"; 

(c) in section 1 (2B) thereof for the words 
"five pounds" there is substituted" £9.50". 

of 1941. 

2. (1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Stray Citatio.n and 
• collectIve 

Dogs (Amendment) OrdlOance, 1984. title. 

(a) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome IX, p. 144; Tome X, p. 315; 
No, XVI of 1979. . 



Commence­
ment. 

2 

(2) This Ordinance and the. Stray Dogs Orqi­
nances, 1941 to 1979, may be cited together as the 
Stray Dogs Ordinanc~s, 1941 to 1984. 

3. This Ordinance shall Come into force on the 
1st day of December, 1984 and shall have effect only 
as respects dogs seized on or after that date. 

K. H. TOUGH, 

Her Majesty's Greffier. 

Cople. may be purchased from 
Her MaJ.'. Greftler, Royal Court Hou .. , Guernsey. 

PRICE 15p 


