Guernsey

Ordinance of the States XXXI

1993
CMade ... . el e e e e 8th December, 1993.
Coming into Operation ... ... .. .. 9th December, 1993.

The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1993

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 8th day of
December, 1993, (a) and in exercise of the powers conferred on them by Article
XXII of the Public Assistance Law, 1937, as amended (b}, hereby order:-

Amendment to the Regulations of 1963
1. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations;, 1963, as amended,

set out in the Schedule to the Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations
Qrdinance, 1963 (c), are further amended as follows:- o

(2) in Regulation 4 (1)(b), for the words "two pounds and ﬁfty new,
pence” substitute "£5";

(b) in paragraph 2(2) of the Schedule to the Regulations, for "£130"
substitute "£140";

(c¢) in paragraph 4 of the Schedule to the Regulations, sub-paragraphs (a)
and (b) are repealed;

(@) Article I of Billet d'Etat No.XXVTI of 1993.

() Ordres en Conseil Vol.XI,p.91; Vol.XIV,p.363;
Vol.XVI,p.264; Vol. XVII,p.255; Vol.XIX,p.149; Vol.XXI,p.34;
Vol.XXII,p.521; Vol.XXIX,p.204 and No.IV of 1990.

) Recueil d'Ordonnances, Tome XII1,p.274; Tome XXII,p.163;
No.XXXIX of 1991; No. XXXVII of 1992.



2

(d) after paragraph 6(3)(i)(d) of the Schedule to the Regulations, insert
the following:-

"(e) any allowance payable under the Family Allowances
(Guernsey) Law, 1959";

(e) for paragraph 10 of the Schedule to the Regulations, substitute the
following:-

"Ordinary maximum rates of outdoor assistance

10. The ordinary maximum rates of outdoor assistance shall be:-

(a) for two persons living together as husband
and wife £63.75

(b) for a person living alone or a householder
not falling within (a) of this paragraph
who is responsible for household necessities

and rent £39.80
(c) for any other person who is -

aged 18 or over £29.05

aged 11 or over but under 18 £24.50

aged 10 or under £21.40.".

Repeals

2. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board (Amendment) Ordmance, 1992
(d) is hereby repealed.

Citation

3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Central Outdoor Assistance Board
Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance, 1993.

Commencement

4. This Ordinance shall come into force on 9 December 1993.

A. G. LE CHEMINANT,
Her Majesty’s Deputy Greffier

d) Ordinance No. XXXVII of 1992.

Copies may be purchased from
Her Majesty’s Greffier, Royal Court House, Guernsey.

PRICE 25p



