
Guernsey

into operation

27th September, 1995.
10th November. 1995.

The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1995.

fiIE STATES, in pursuance of their n€solution of the 26th day of July, 1995(a),

and in exercise of the powers confened upon them by Article )OGI of the Public

Assistance Law, 193?, as amended(b), hereby order:-

Amendment to the Resulations of 1963.

1. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Begulations, 1963, as amended, set

out in the Schedule to the Central Outdoor Assistance Board Eegulations Ordinance,

1963(c), are further amended as followe-

(a) in Regul,ation 1(1) inmediately after the definition of "net weekly

earnings" the following words are inserted-

Island of

xxIv
1995

Ordinance of the States

Made

Coming

(a)

(b)

Article )C of Billet dttat No. XVII of 1995.

Ordres en Conseil Vol. XI, p. 91; Vol. XIV, p. 363; Vol. XVI, p. 264; Vol. XVII, p.
255; Vol. XDL p, 149; Vol. )O(I, p. 34; Vol. )OfiI, p. 521; Vol. )O(P' p. 204; and No.
IV of 1990.

Recueil d'Ordonnances, Tome XIII, p. 2?4; Tome )OGI, p. 163; No. )OO(D( of 1991;
No. )OOG of 1993; No. )OO(W of 1994.

Island of Guernsey 

Ordinance of the States XXIV 
1995 

Made 
Coming into operation 

27th September, 1995. 
10th November, 1995. 

The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations 
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1995. 

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 26th day of July. 1995(a), 

and in exercise of the powers conferred upon them by Article xxn of the Public 

Assistance Law, 1937, as amended(b), hereby order:-

Amendment to the Regulations of 1963. 

1. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations, 1963, as amended, set 

out in the Schedule to the Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations Ordinarice, 

1963(c), are further amended as follows-

(a) in Regulation 1(1) immedistely after the defmition of "net weekly 

earnings" the following words are inserted-

(a) Article XI of Billet d'Etat No. xvn of1995. 

(b) Ordres en Conseil Vol. Xl, p. 91; VoL XIV, p. 363; VoL XVI, p. 264; Vol. xvn, p. 
255; Vol. XIX, p. 149; Vol. XXI, p. 34; Vol. xxn, p. 521; Vol. xxrv:, p. 204; and No. 
IV of 1990. 

(c) RecueiJ d'Ordonnances, Tome xm, p. 274; Tome xxn, p. 163; No. XXXIX of 1991; 
No. XXXI of 1993; No. XXXIV of 1994. 



"and for the purposes of the definition of the expression "net weekly

earnings" there shall be included any invalid care allowance payable in

accordance with the Attendance and Invalid Care Allowances

(Guernsey) Law, 1984;";

O) in paragraph 2(2) of the Schedule to the Regulations, for "€150"

substitute "€162";

(c) for paragraph 6(1) of the Sehedule to the Regulations substitute the

following paragraph-

"(1) There shall be wholly disregarded-

(a) any payment or paym.ents of a temporary nature

from any charitable source;

(b) any attendance allowance granted under the

Attendance and Invalid Care Allowances (Guernsey)

Law. 19&1.":

(d) for paragraph 10 of the Schedule to the Regulations, substitute the

following paragraph-

"Ordinarv maximun rates of

10. The ordinaryma:<imumrates ofoutdoor assistance shall be-

(a) for two persons living together as husband and wife,

€80.00;

(b) for a person living alone or a householder not falling

within subparagraph (a) who is responsible for

household necessities and rent. €48.00:

2 

"and for the purposes of the defmition of the expression "net weekly 

earnings" there shall be included any invalid care allowance payable in 

accordance with the Attendance and Invalid Care Allowances 

(Guernsey) Law, 1984;"; 

(b) in paragraph 2(2) of the Schedule to the Regulations, for "£150" 

substitute "£162"; 

(c) for paragraph 6(1) of the Schedule to the Regulations substitute the 

following paragraph-

"(1) There shall be wholly disregarded-

(a) any payment or payments of a temporary nature 

from any charitable source; 

(b) any attendance allowance granted under the 

Attendance and Invalid Care Allowances (Guernsey) 

Law, 1984."; 

(d) for paragraph 10 of the Schedule to the Regulations, substitute the 

following paragraph-

"Ordinary maximum rates of outdoor assistance. 

10. The ordinary maximum rates of outdoor assistance shall be-

(a) for two persons living together as husband and wife, 

£80.00; 

(b) for a person living alone or a householder not falling 

within subparagraph (a) who is responsible for 

household necessities and rent, £48.00; 



3

(c) for any other person who is-

(i) aged 18 or over, €3?.00;

(ii) aged 16 or over but under 18,929.00;

(iii) aged 13 or over but under 16, €26,60;

(iv) aged 11 or over but under 13, €24.00;

(v) aged 5 or over but under 11, €22,00;

(vi) aged under 5, 92L.00.' .

Repeal.

2. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance'

1994(d) is hereby repealed,

Citation.

8. This Ordinance may be cited as the Central Outdoor Assistance Board

Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance, 1995.

Commencement.

4. This Ordinance shall come into force on 10th day of November 1995.

K. H. TOUGH,
Her Majesty's Greffier.

(d) Ordinance No. )QO[V of 1994.

3 

(c) for any other person who is· 

(i) aged 18 or over, £37.00; 

(ii)aged 16 or over but under 18, £29.00; 

(iii) aged 13 or over but under 16, £26.50; 

(iv) aged 11 or over but under 13, £24.00; 

(v) aged 5 or over but under 11, £22.00; 

(vi) aged under 5, £21.00.". 

Repeal. 

2. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance, 

1994(d) is hereby repealed. 

Citation. 

3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Central Outdoor Assistance Board 

Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance, 1995. 

Commencement. 

4. This Ordinance shall come into force on 10th day of November 1995. 

(d) Ordinance No. XXXIV of 1994. 

K. H. TOUGH, 
Her Majesty's Greffier. 


