Island of Guernsey

Ordinance of the States  XXVIII
| 1996

Made ... .. v e e ae e 26th September, 1996.
Coming into operation ... .. .. .. .. 10th January, 1997,

The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1996.

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 27th day of June 1996(a),
and in exercise of the powers conferred upon them by Article XXII of the Public
Assistance Law, 1937, as amended(b), hereby order:-

Amendment to the Regulations of 1963.
1. The Central Qutdoor Assistance Board Regulations, 1963, as amended, set
out in the Schedule to the Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations Ordinance,

1963(c), are further amended as follows-

(a) the text of regulation 3 is renumbered as paragraph (1) and the
following paragraphs are inserted thereafter-

(a) Article VII of Billet d’Etat No. XIII of 1996.

(b) Ordres en Conseil Vol, XI, p. 91; Vol. XIV, p. 363; Vol. XVI, p. 264; Vol. XVII, p.
255; Vol. XIX, p. 149; Vol. XXI, p. 34; Vol. XXIT, p. 521; Vol. XXIX, p. 204; and No.
IV of 1990.

(¢}  Recueil d’Ordonnances, Tome XIII, p. 274; Tome XXII, p. 163; No. XXXIX of 1991;
No. XXXT of 1993; No. XXXIV of 1994; and No. XXIV of 1995.



(b)

(c)

(@

(e)

2

"(2) Where the weekly amount of assistance determined in
accordance with the provisions of these regulations would be less than
£1, no assistance shall be payable.

3) Where the weekly amount of assistance determined in
accordance with these regulations exceeds £1, but is not a multiple of
25p, the amount by which it exceeds such a multiple shall, if it is 13p or
more, be treated as 25p and, if it is 12p or less, be disregarded.”;

in paragraph 2(2) of the Schedule to the Regulations, for "£162.00"
substitute "£168.50";

in paragraph 6 of the Schedule to the Regulations-

@ for the words "four pounds" in subparagraph (2) substitute
"£10"

(i) for the words "two pounds" in subparagraph (3)(i) substitute
|I£5ll;

(i) for each occurrence of the words "four pounds" in

subparagraph (8)(ii) substitute "£10";

in paragraph 7 of the Schedule to the Regulations for the words “ten
pounds" substitute "£15";

for paragraph 10 of the Schedule to the Regulations, substitute the
following-
"Ordinary maximum rates of outdoor assistance.

10. The ordinary maximum rates of outdoor assistance shall be-

(@) . for two persons living together as husband and wife,
£90.00; '



(b)  for a person living alone or a householder not falling
within (a) of this paragraph who is responsible for
household necessities and rént, £55.00;

()  for any other person who is-

(i} aged 18 and over, £44.00;
(ii) aged 16 or over but under 18, £33.00;
(iil) aged 13 or over but under 16, £28.00;
(iv) aged 11 or over but under 13, £24.00;
(v) aged 5 or over but under 11, £22.00;
(vi) aged under 5, £20.00"
Repeals.
2. The Central Outdoor Assistance Board Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance,
1995(d) is hereby repealed.
Citation,
3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Central Outdoor Assistance Board

Regulations (Amendment) Ordinance, 1996.

Commencement.

4. This Ordinance shall come into force on 10th day of January 1997.

K. H. TOUGH,
Her Majesty’s-Greffier.

(d) Ordinance No. XXIV of 1995.



