
Guernsey 

Ordinance of the States XliV 
1988 

Made 
Co'ming into Operation 

27th July, 1988. 
1st August, 1988. 

The Road Trdc Olences (Increase in 
Fines) Ordinance, 1988 

THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution 
of the 25th day of May, 1988, hereby order:-

1. In Article XII(4) of the Ordinance entitled Failure to 
" Ordonnance relative au Trafic Vehiculaire en cette stop after, 

, or report, 
lIe" of 2nd March 1929(a), for" fifty pounds' there certain 
is substituted "£200". accidents. 

2. In section 2 of the Ordinance entitled "Ordon- Carrying 

nance SuppIementaire a l'Ordonnance ayant rapport passebt.tgerls 
T fi V 'h· I· II d 2 1929" on lCYC es. au ra c e leu alre en cette e u mars 

of 14th December 1929(b), for "£5" there is sub­
stituted "£100 '~. 

3. (1) For section 8 of the Road Traffic (Construc- Construction 

tion and Use of Motor Vehicles) Ordinance, 1970(c), a~d use 
there is substituted: 0 ences. 

(a) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, p. 184 and 194; Tome 
XVI, p. 187. 

(b) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, p. 192. 
(c) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XVI, p. 339; Tome XVII, 

p. 324; Tome XVIII, .. pp. 124 and 217; Tome XX, pp. 218 
and 245; Tome XXI, p. 406; Tome XXII, p. 408; Ordi­
nance No. VII of 1984. 



2 

" 8. (1) A person who contravenes any of the 
provisions of this Ordinance is guilty of an 
offence and liable, on conviction, to a fine not 
exceeding £200. 

(2) A person who-
(a) fails to comply with any condi­

tion attached to a permIssIOn 
granted under section 5 of this 
Ordinance; or 

(b) wilfully obstructs any person in 
the exercise of his powers under 
the provisions of section 7 of 
this Ordinance; or 

(c) for the purpose of obtaining per­
mission in pursuance of the pro­
visions of section 1 or section 3 
of this Ordinance or in furnish­
ing any information which he is 
required to furnish, makes any 
statement which he knows to 
be false in a material particular 
or recklessly makes any state­
ment which is false in a material 
particular or furnishes or allows 
to be furnished any document 
or information which he knows 
to he false in a material 
particular, 

is guilty of an offence and liable, oil conviction, 
to a fine not exceeding [100.". 

(2) Section 8( c) of the Road Traffic (Construc­
tion and Use of Motor Vehicles) (Amendment) 
Ordinance, 1971 (d) is repealed. 

(d) Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XVII, p.324. 



3 

4. This Ordinance may be cited as the Road Citation. 

Traffic Offences (Increase in Fines) Ordinance, 1988. 

5. This Ordinance shall come into force on 1st Commence­
ment. August, 1988 and shall have effect only as respects 

offences committed on or after that date. 

K. H. TOUGH, 

Her Maje;gty's Greffier. 


