ISLAND OF ALDERNEY
XVI

ORDINANCE OF THE STATES 2013

IVIAAE oo 23" October 2013

Coming iNto fOrCe .....coocvvvvieiieciece e 1% January 2014

The Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees) Ordinance, 2013

THE STATES OF ALDERNEY, in exercise of the powers conferred on

them by sections 159 and 164 of the Companies (Alderney) Law 19942 and of all
other powers enabling them in that behalf, hereby order:-

Amendment of the 1994 Law.
1. The 1994 Law is amended as set out in sections 2 and 3.

Increase of late filing fee.

2. In section 107(7) of the 1994 Law —
@) in paragraph (a) for “£61” substitute “£80”;
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£120” substitute “£160”;
(© in paragraph (c) for “£180” substitute “£240”.

Increase of fee to restore to register.

3. In section 108(4)(b) of the 1994 Law, for “£180” substitute “£240”.

Interpretation.

4. 1) In this Ordinance, the "1994 Law" means the Companies (Alderney)
Law, 1994, and, unless the context requires otherwise, words and
phrases used for the purpose of this Ordinance have the same meaning
as used for the purpose of the 1994 Law.

(2)  The Interpretation (Guernsey) Law, 1948b shall apply to the
interpretation of this Ordinance.

a Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXXV(2), p. 777 as amended by Ordres en Conseil

Vol. XLII(1), p. 420 and Alderney Ordinance No. VIII of 2012 and to which there are
other amendments not relevant to this Ordinance.

Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIlI, p.355.



3) Any reference in this Ordinance to an enactment is a reference thereto
as from time to time amended, repealed and re-enacted (with or without
modification), extended or applied.

Repeal.

5. Sections 2 and 3 of the Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees) Ordinance, 2012
are repealed.

Citation.

6. This Ordinance may be cited as the Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees)
Ordinance, 2013.

Commencement.

7. This Ordinance shall come into force on 1% January, 2014.

S. E. KELLY
Greffier
£0.61
Copies may be purchased from
The States Office
Island Hall
Extensive Alderney legislation is now available online at
www.guernseylegalresources.gg


http://www.guernseylegalresources.gg/

