GREFFE
ROYAL COURT

22 0CT 20%
o7,
GUERNSEY

GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

2014 No. &

The Public Records (Fees for Registration and Certified
Copies of Documents) Regulations, 2014

Made ., 2014
Coming into operation I January, 2015
Laid before the States , 2015

THE TREASURY AND RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, in exercise of

the powers conferred on it by sections 1 and 5 of the Fees, Charges and Penalties

(Guernsey) Law, 2007" as amended, and all other powers enabling it in that behalf,

hereby makes the following regulations:-

Registration fees for documents.
1. In section 1 of the Public Records (Fees for Registration and

Certified Copies of Documents) Ordinance, 1960 ("the 1960 Ordinance") -
(a) in paragraph (a), for "£55"substitute "£60", and

(by  in paragraphs (b} and (c), for "£4.50" substitute
"£5.00".

a

2011.
b

Order in Council No. VII of 2008; No. VIII of 2010; Ordinance No. IV of

Recueil d’Ordonnances Tome XII, p. 398: Tome XXI, p. 59; Tome XXXI,
p. 522; G.S.1. No. 60 of 2008; No. 110 of 2010; No. 58 of 2012.



Fees for certified copies of documents.

2. In section 2 of the 1960 Ordinance -

(a) in paragraph (a), for "£3.00" substitute "£3.50", and

(b) in paragraph (b), for "£5.00" substitute "£5.50".

Fees for uncertified copies of registered documents.

3. In section 2A of the 1960 Qrdinance -

(a) in paragraphs (a) and (b)(ii), for "£1.50" substitute
"£2.00", and

(b) in paragraph (b)(i), for "£4.00" substitute "£4.50".

Fees in respect of documents creating charge on land.

4, In paragraphs (a) and (b) of section 2B of the 1960 Ordinance, for
"£40" substitute "£50".

Interpretation.

5. Any reference in these Regulations to an enactment is a reference
thereto as from time to time amended, re-enacted (with or without modification),

extended or applied.

Repeal.
6. The Public Records (Fees for Registration and Certified Copies of

Documents) Regulations, 2012° are repealed.

¢ G.S.1. No. 58 of 2012.



Citation.
7. These Regulations may be cited as the Public Records (Fees for

Registration and Certified Copies of Documents) Regulations, 2014.

Commencement.

8. These Regulations shall come into force on 1* January, 2015.

Dated this 1% day of Odets, 2014

DEPUTY G. A. ST PIER
Minister of the Treasury and Resources Department

For and on behalf of the Department

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the regulations)

These Regulations increase the fees payable on registration at the Greffe of

conveyances and bonds, etc, and for the provision of copies of such documents.

The Regulations come into force on 1* January, 2015.



