
Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 1 

PROJET DE LOI 

 

ENTITLED 

 

The Family Allowances (Guernsey) (Amendment) Law, 

1976 * 

 

[CONSOLIDATED TEXT] 

 

NOTE 

 

This consolidated version of the enactment incorporates all amendments 

listed in the footnote below. However, while it is believed to be accurate 

and up to date, it is not authoritative and has no legal effect, having been 

prepared in-house for the assistance of the Law Officers. No warranty is 

given that the text is free of errors and omissions, and no liability is 

accepted for any loss arising from its use. The authoritative text of the 

enactment and of the amending instruments may be obtained from Her 

Majesty' s Greffier, Royal Court House, Guernsey, GY1 2PB. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                                                                                                                                           
*  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXVI, p. 150. See also the Children (Guernsey and 

Alderney) Law, 2008 (No. XIV of 2009). 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 2 

 

© States of Guernsey



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 3 

PROJET DE LOI 

 

ENTITLED 

 

The Family Allowances (Guernsey) (Amendment) Law, 

1976 

 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

 

1. Amendment of principal Law. 

2. Saving. 

3. Repeals. 

4. Citation, collective title and commencement. 

 

SCHEDULE Laws Repealed. 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 4 

PROJET DE LOI 

 

ENTITLED 

 

The Family Allowances (Guernsey) (Amendment) Law, 

1976 

 

 THE STATES,  in pursuance of their Resolution of the thirty-first day of 

March, nineteen hundred and seventy-six, have approved the following provisions 

which, subject to the Sanction of Her Most Excellent Majesty in Council, shall have 

force of law in the Islands of Guernsey, Alderney, Herm and Jethou.  

 

Amendment of principal Law. 

 1.  The Family Allowances (Guernsey) Law, 1950
a
,  as amended

b
 

(hereafter in this Law referred to as "the principal Law"), is hereby further 

amended as follows, that is to say – 

 

(a) section two thereof is hereby repealed and the following 

section is hereby substituted therefor – 

 

        " 2.  (1) A person shall be treated for the purposes of 

this Law as a child – 

 

(a) during any period whilst he is under the 

                                                                                                                                           
a  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIV, p. 332. 
b  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XV, p. 212; Vol. XVI, p. 280; Vol. XVIII, p. 367; 

Vol. XX, pp. 11 and 63; Vol. XXI p. 34; Vol. XXII, p. 318; and Vol XXIII, p. 

238. 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 5 

upper limit of the compulsory school 

age within the meaning of the Education 

(Guernsey) Law, 1970
c
,  and 

 

(b) during any period before the first day of 

August next following the day on which 

he attains the age of nineteen years 

whilst he is receiving full-time 

education by attendance at a recognised 

educational establishment. 

 

  (2) For the purposes of this section, a person who 

at any time attains the upper limit of the compulsory school age as 

aforesaid shall not be treated as being under that limit at any time 

thereafter, notwithstanding any subsequent change in that limit.",  

 

(b) subsection (1) of section three thereof is hereby repealed and 

the following subsection is hereby substituted therefor – 

 

         " (1) Subject to the provisions of this Law, for the 

purposes of this Law each of the following shall be treated as 

constituting a family, that is to say – 

 

(a) a man and his wife living together, any 

child or children being issue of theirs, 

his or hers, and any child or children 

being maintained by them, 

 

                                                                                                                                           
c  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXII, p. 318. 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 6 

(b) a man not having a wife or not living 

together with his wife (and not being a 

man cohabiting with a woman as 

mentioned in paragraph (d) of this 

subsection), any child or children being 

issue of his, and any child or children 

being maintained by him, 

 

(c) a woman not having a husband or not 

living together with her husband (and 

not being a woman cohabiting with a 

man as mentioned in the next 

succeeding paragraph), any child or 

children being issue of hers, and any 

child or children being maintained by 

her, 

 

(d) a man and a woman cohabiting as 

husband and wife, any child or children 

being issue of theirs, his or hers, and 

any child or children being maintained 

by them, him or her,  

 

and the expression "issue" means issue of the first generation.",
1
 

 

(c) in subsection (2) of section three thereof – 

 

(i) immediately after the words and comma "or one of 

them,", there are hereby inserted the words and 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 7 

comma "of the man and woman cohabiting as husband 

and wife or one of them,", and 

 

(ii) for the reference to paragraph (a), (b) or (c) of 

subsection (1) of that section there is hereby 

substituted a reference to paragraph (a), (b), (c) or (d) 

of that subsection, 

 

(d) in subsection (3) of section three thereof, immediately after 

the words and comma "living together," there are hereby 

inserted the words and comma "a man and a woman 

cohabiting as husband and wife,",  

 

(e) subsection (1) and subsection (2) of section four thereof are 

hereby repealed and the following subsections are hereby 

respectively substituted therefor – 

 

         " (1) Subject to the provisions of subsection (2) and 

subsection (3) of this section, allowances for any family shall belong – 

 

(a) in the case of the family of a man and 

his wife living together, to the wife, 

 

(b) in the case of the family of such a man 

as is mentioned in paragraph (b) of 

subsection (1) of the last preceding 

section, to him, 

 

(c) in the case of the family of such a 

woman as is mentioned in paragraph (c) 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 8 

of subsection (1) of the last preceding 

section, to her,  

 

(d) in the case of the family of a man and 

woman cohabiting as husband and wife, 

to the woman. 

 

  (2) Sums to be paid on account of an allowance for 

the family of a man and his wife living together shall be receivable 

by the man or by the wife, and sums to be paid on account of an 

allowance for the family of a man and woman cohabiting as husband 

and wife shall be receivable by the man or by the woman.",  

 

(f) in subsection (3) of section four thereof, immediately after the 

words "living together", there are hereby inserted the words 

"or of a man and woman cohabiting as husband and wife",  

 

(g) paragraph (b) of subsection (2) of section six thereof is hereby 

repealed and the following two paragraphs are hereby 

substituted therefor – 

 

         "(b) if the claim was not made within three 

months from the date of entitlement and 

the claimant shows to the satisfaction of 

the Administrator that he had good 

cause for the delay in making the claim, 

on the date of entitlement or at the 

beginning of the period of twelve 

months immediately preceding the date 

on which the claim was made, 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 9 

whichever is the later, or 

 

(c) in any other case, at the beginning of 

the period of three months immediately 

preceding the date on which the claim 

was made:",  

 

(h) in subsection (2) of section seven thereof, for the words 

"three months" there are hereby substituted the words "twelve 

months", 

 

(i) in section eight thereof, immediately after subsection (2), 

there is hereby inserted the following subsection – 

 

         " (2A) In the case of a sum paid as on account of an 

allowance for the family of a man and woman cohabiting as husband 

and wife which the woman could under subsection (1) of this section 

be required to repay, the man may be required to repay it.",  

 

(j) in section nine thereof, for the words "fifty pounds" there are 

hereby substituted the words "four hundred pounds",
2
 

 

(k) in section fourteen thereof – 

 

(i) paragraph (c) of subsection (1) is hereby repealed, and 

 

(ii) in subsection (2), for the words "ten pounds" there are 

hereby substituted the words "fifty pounds",
3
 

 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 10 

(l) in subsection (2) of section fifteen thereof, the words "or 

section twenty-three" are hereby repealed, 

 

(m) in section nineteen thereof – 

 

(i) in subsection (5), immediately after the word "father", 

there are hereby inserted the words "except where the 

child’s father and mother are cohabiting as husband 

and wife", 

 

(ii) in subsection (7), for the word "school", wherever it 

occurs, there are hereby substituted the words 

"recognised educational establishment", and 

 

(iii) in subsection (8), for the words "sixteen" and 

"sixteenth" there are hereby respectively substituted 

the words "nineteen" and "nineteenth",  

 

(n) in subsection (1) of section twenty-one thereof – 

 

(i) the definition of the expression "apprentice" is hereby 

repealed, and 

 

(ii) for the full-stop at the end of that subsection there is 

hereby substituted a semi-colon, and immediately 

thereafter there is hereby inserted the following 

definition – 

 

        " "recognised educational establishment" means an 

establishment recognised by the Administrator as being or as 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 11 

comparable to, a university, college or school, and 

regulations may prescribe the circumstances in which a 

person is or is not to be treated for the purposes of this Law 

as receiving full-time education by attendance at such an 

establishment.", 

 

(o) in section twenty-two thereof – 

 

(i) in subsection (1), for the words from the beginning of 

that subsection to the end of paragraph (b) thereof 

there are hereby substituted the following words and 

paragraphs – 

 

           " It shall be a condition of the right to any 

allowance for the family of a man and his wife living together, or of 

a man and woman cohabiting as husband and wife, that – 

 

(a) the man or his wife, or the man or 

woman cohabiting as aforesaid, as the 

case may be, was born in Guernsey, or 

 

(b) such requirements as to residence, place 

of birth or other matters as may be 

prescribed are satisfied as respects the 

man or his wife or the man or woman 

cohabiting as aforesaid, as the case may 

be, according to such rules as may be 

prescribed.",  

 

(ii) immediately after subsection (2), there is hereby 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 12 

inserted the following subsection – 

 

         " (2A) It shall be a condition of the right to any 

allowance for the family of a man and woman cohabiting as husband 

and wife that each or one of them is in Guernsey.", and 

 

(iii) in subsection (4), for the words "two last preceding 

subsections" there are hereby substituted the words 

"three last preceding subsections", 

 

(p) in subsection (1) of section twenty-three thereof, for the 

words "it shall be lawful for the Authority by regulation to" 

there are hereby substituted the words "the States of Guernsey 

may by Ordinance", 

 

(q) sub-paragraph (2) of paragraph 1 of the Schedule thereto is 

hereby repealed and the following sub-paragraph is hereby 

substituted therefor – 

 

         " (2) For the purposes of this paragraph, a man and 

his wife living together or a man and woman cohabiting as husband 

and wife shall be treated as one person and amounts contributed by 

them respectively shall be aggregated accordingly, and references to 

a person shall be construed as references to such persons as are 

mentioned in paragraphs (a), (b), (c) or (d) respectively of subsection 

(1) of section three of this Law, that is to say, a man and his wife 

living together, such a man as is mentioned in the said paragraph (b), 

such a woman as is mentioned in the said paragraph (c), and a man 

and a woman cohabiting as husband and wife.".  

 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 13 

 
 NOTE 

 

In accordance with the provisions of the Children (Guernsey and Alderney) 

Law, 2008, section 123, Schedule, paragraph 23 (shown, incorrectly, in the 

printed version of the 2008 Law as paragraph 22), with effect from 4th 

January, 2010, this Law is one of those specific enactments that the States 

may repeal, amend, extend, adapt, modify or disapply, and make 

transitional and savings provisions in relation to, by Ordinance made under 

the said section 123.  

 
 

Saving. 

 2.  The amendment by this Law of subsection (1) of section twenty-three 

of the principal Law shall not affect any arrangements or regulations made under 

that section immediately before the coming into force of this Law, but any such 

regulations shall remain in force as if this Law had not been passed until the 

arrangements to which they relate are terminated or until the regulations are 

revoked by an Ordinance of the States of Guernsey under this section. 

 

Repeals. 

 3.  The Laws mentioned in the first column of the Schedule to this Law 

are hereby repealed to the extent specified in the second column of that Schedule. 

 

Citation, collective title and commencement. 

 4.  (1) This Law may be cited as "The Family Allowances 

(Guernsey) (Amendment) Law, 1976". 

 

  (2) This Law, the Family Allowances (Guernsey) Law, 1950, the 

Family Allowances (Amendment) Law, 1955, and the Family Allowances 

(Amendment) (No. 2) Law, 1965, may be cited together as the Family Allowances 

(Guernsey) Laws, 1950 to 1976. 

 

  (3) This Law shall come into force on such day as shall be 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 14 

appointed in that behalf by Ordinance of the States. 

 

 
 NOTE 

 

The Law was brought into force on 12th January, 1977 by the Family 

Allowances (Guernsey) (Amendment) Law, 1976 (Commencement) 

Ordinance, 1977, section 1.  

 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0001 15 

             SCHEDULE          Section three 

LAWS REPEALED 

 

 

Law 

 

 

Extent of repeal 

The Family Allowances (Guernsey) (Amendment) 

Law, 1951 

The whole Law 

The Family Allowances (Amendment) Law, 1955 Section two 

The Family Allowances (Amendment) Law, 1961 The whole Law 

The Family Allowances (Amendment) Law, 1965 The whole Law 

The Family Allowances (Amendment) (No. 2) 

Law, 1965 

Paragraph (a) of section one, 

section three and subsection 

(2) of section four 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                                                                                                                    

1  For subsequent amendments, see the consolidated text of the Family 

Allowances (Guernsey) Law, 1950. 
2  For subsequent amendments, see the consolidated text of the Family 

Allowances (Guernsey) Law, 1950. 
3  For subsequent amendments, see the consolidated text of the Family 

Allowances (Guernsey) Law, 1950. 


