GREFFE
ROYAL COURT
13 JUL 2017
GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT T
2017 No. 4O - GUERNSEY
The Public Transport (Fees) (Guernsey)
Regulations, 2017

Made 13th July, 2017
Coming into operation 1st August , 2017
Laid before the States , 2017

THE COMMITTEE FOR THE ENVIRONMENT & INFRASTRUCTURE, in

exercise of the powers conferred on it by sections 1 and 5 of the Fees, Charges and

Penalties (Guernsey) Law, 20072 and all other powers enabling it in that behalf,

hereby makes the following Regulations:-

Amendment of the Public Transport Ordinance, 1986.

1. @ The Public Transport Ordinance, 1986b is amended as follows.
) In section 12(1), for "£30" substitute "£40".
3) In section 12(2), for "£10" substitute "£17".

4) In section 12(3), for "£15" substitute "£17".

a Order in Council No. VII of 2008; amended by Ordinance No. IV of 2011; and
No. IX of 2016. There are other amendments not relevant to these Regulations.

b Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXIIL p. 351; amended by Ordinance No. XLIII
of 2013; G.S.I. No 10 of 2013. There are other amendments not relevant to these
Regulations.



(D) In section 14(3), for "£10" substitute "£20".

6) In section 42(6)(a), for "£20" substitute "£30".

) In section 42(6)(c), for "£10" substitute "£15".

Amendment of the Permits to Drive Public Service Vehicles Ordinance, 1986.

2. 8] The Road Traffic (Permits to Drive Public Service Vehicles)

Ordinance, 1986° is amended as follows.

2) In section 4(4)(b), for "£20" substitute "£50".

3) In section 7 for "£10" substitute "£17".

Interpretation.

3. §))] In these Regulations, unless the context requires otherwise -

"enactment” includes a Law, an Ordinance and any subordinate
legislation and includes any provision or portion of a Law, an Ordinance or

any subordinate legislation, and

"subordinate legislation" means any regulation, rule, order, rule of
court, resolution, scheme, byelaw or other instrument made under any
statutory, customary or inherent power and having legislative effect, but does

not include an Ordinance..

¢ Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXIII, p. 393; amended by Ordinance No. XLII
of 2013. There are other amendments not relevant to these Regulations.



(2) The Interpretation (Guernsey) Law, 19484 applies to the

interpretation of these Regulations.

3) Any reference in these Regulations to an enactment is a
reference thereto as from time to time amended, re-enacted (with or without

modification), extended or applied.

Citation and commencement.
4. These Regulations may be cited as the Public Transport (Fees)

(Guernsey) Regulations, 2017 and shall come into force on the 1st August, 2017.

Dated this ﬂ% day of U’b , 2017

»

B. BREHAUT
President of the Committee for the Environment & Infrastructure

For and on behalf of the Committee

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations)
These Regulations make provision for the increase of fees payable under the Public

Transport Ordinance 1986 for -

(a) the grant or renewal of public service vehicle licences;
(b) the transfer of a public service vehicle licence;
() the inspection of a public service vehicle; and

d Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIII, p. 355.



(d) the examination of a taximeter;

and also increase the fee payable for an Island knowledge test taken for the purposes
of an application for a permit to drive a public service vehicle under the Road Traffic
(Permits to Drive Public Service Vehicles) Ordinance, 1986, and the fee payable for

the grant or renewal of such permits.

These Regulations come into force on the 1st day of August, 2017.



