
Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0002 1 

PROJET DE LOI 

 

ENTITLED 

 

The Public Health and Related Offences (Increase in Fines) 

(Guernsey) Law, 1986 * 

 

[CONSOLIDATED TEXT] 

 

NOTE 

 

This consolidated version of the enactment incorporates all amendments 

listed in the footnote below. It has been prepared for the Guernsey Law 

website and is believed to be accurate and up to date, but it is not 

authoritative and has no legal effect. No warranty is given that the text is free 

of errors and omissions, and no liability is accepted for any loss arising from 

its use. The authoritative text of the enactment and of the amending 

instruments may be obtained from Her Majesty's Greffier, Royal Court 

House, Guernsey, GY1 2PB. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

© States of Guernsey

                                                                                                                                           
*  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXIX, p. 329; as amended by the European 

Communities (Food and Feed Controls) (Guernsey) Ordinance, 2016 (No. XXI of 

2016). 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0002 2 

PROJET DE LOI 

 

ENTITLED 

 

The Public Health and Related Offences (Increase in Fines) 

(Guernsey) Law, 1986 

 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

 

1. Increases in maximum fines. 

2. Citation. 

3. Extent. 

 

SCHEDULE Increase in maximum fines. 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0002 3 

PROJET DE LOI 

 

ENTITLED 

 

The Public Health and Related Offences (Increase in Fines) 

(Guernsey) Law, 1986 

 

 THE STATES, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 11th day of December 

1985, have approved the following provisions which, subject to the Sanction of Her 

Most Excellent Majesty in Council, shall have force of law in the Islands of 

Guernsey, Alderney, Herm and Jethou. 

 

Increases in maximum fines. 

 1. The enactments mentioned in the left hand column of the Schedule to 

this Law are amended as set out in the right hand column of that Schedule. 

 

Citation. 

 2. This Law may be cited as the Public Health and Related Offences 

(Increase in Fines) (Guernsey) Law, 1986. 

 

Extent. 

 3. This Law shall have effect in Guernsey, Alderney, Herm and Jethou. 

 

 
 NOTE 

 

The Law received Royal Sanction on 5th November, 1986 and was registered 

on the Records of the Island of Guernsey and came into force on 16th 

December, 1986. 

 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0002 4 

             SCHEDULE      Section 1 

INCREASE IN MAXIMUM FINES 

 

 

Enactment 

 

 

Amendment 

The Law entitled "Loi Relative à la 

Santé Publique, 1934", registered on 

17th March, 1934
a
. 

In section 3(1), for" five pounds" 

substitute "£50";
1
 

 

in section 3(3), for "twenty pounds" 

substitute £200".
2
 

The Law entitled "The Public Health 

(Vermin) (Guernsey) Law, 1948", 

registered on 30th October, 1948
b
. 

In section 1(2), for "five pounds" 

substitute "£50" and for "forty shillings" 

substitute "£20";
3
 

 

in section 12, for "five pounds" 

substitute "£50".
4
 

The Law entitled "The Public Health 

(Vessels and Aircraft) (Guernsey) Law, 

1950", registered on 12th August, 1950
c
. 

In section 4, for "one hundred pounds" 

substitute" £400" and for "fifty pounds" 

substitute "£200". 

[…] 

 

[…] 

 

 
 NOTE 

 

In the Schedule, the words omitted in square brackets in the first and second 

columns were repealed by the European Communities (Food and Feed 

Controls) (Guernsey) Ordinance, 2016, section 93, Schedule 12, with effect 

from 3rd October, 2019. 

 
 

 

                                                                                                                                           
a  Ordres en Conseil Vol. IX, p. 386; Vol. XIX, p. 214; Recueil d'Ordonnances 

Tome IX, p. 280; Tome XIII, p. 264. 
b  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIII, p. 367; Vol. XXII, p. 318; Recueil 

d'Ordonnances Tome X, p. 11. 
c  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XIV, p. 402. 



Consolidated text 

© States of Guernsey  v.0002 5 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                                                                                                                                           

1  For subsequent amendments see the consolidated text of the Loi Relative à la 

Santé Publique, 1934. 
2  For subsequent amendments see the consolidated text of the Loi Relative à la 

Santé Publique, 1934. 
3  For subsequent amendments see the consolidated text of the Public Health 

(Vermin) (Guernsey) Law, 1948. 
4  For subsequent amendments see the consolidated text of the Public Health 

(Vermin) (Guernsey) Law, 1948. 


