
GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMEN'

2019 No.\^

GREFFE
ROYAL COURT

5 DEC 2019 ^^S.
Q^

GUERNSEY

The Public Highways (Temporary Road Closures)

(Fees and Penalties) (Amendment)

Order, 2019

Made

Coming into operation

Laid before the States

16th January, 2019

16th January, 2019

,2019

THE COMMITTEE FOR THE ENVIRONMENT AND

INFRASTRUCTURE, in exercise of the powers conferred on it by sections 3(1) and

3(3) of the Public Highways (Co-ordination of Temporary Road Closures etc.)

(Guernsey) Law, 2003 and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby order:-

Amendment of Order.

1. The Public Highways (Temporary Road Closures) (Fees and Penalties)

Order, 2016 is amended as follows.

2. In Article l(2)(a), for "£100" substitute "£103".

3. In Article 2(l)(a), for "£100" substitute "£103".

4. For Schedule 1 substitute the Schedule 1 set out in the Schedule to this

a Order in Council No. XXV of 2003; as amended by Ordinance No. XXXIII of
2003 and No. IX of 2016.

b G.S.I No. 86 of 2016; as amended by G.S. I. No. 119 of 2017.

1



Order.

Citation and commencement.

5. This Order may be cited as the Public Highways (Temporary Road

Closures) (Fees and Penalties) (Amendment) Order, 2019 and shall come into force

on the 16th January, 2019.

Dated this 16th day of January, 2019

^^^
c-^-^.—
DEPUTY B. L. BREHAUT

President of the Committee for the Environment & Infrastructure

For and on behalf of the Committee

2



SCHEDULE

Article 4

"SCHEDULE 1

Article l(2)(b)

Variable fee payable in relation to an application made under section 2 of
the Law per square metre of road to be resurfaced or part thereof

Class of road
which is the

subject of the
application

Length of time since the road which is the subject of the
application was resurfaced by or on behalf of the

Committee

0-5 years 6-30 years
11 or more years

(or has never

previously been
resurfaced)

Inter-Harbour

Route

£90 £65 £32

Traffic Priority
Route

£49 £35 £18

Circulation

Route

Neighbourhood
Road

£39

£34

£28

£24

£14

£12".

3



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Order)

This Order amends the Public Highways (Temporary Road Closures) (Fees and

Penalties) Order, 2016 to increase the fees payable to the Committee for the

Environment & Infrastructure in respect of applications under the Public Highways

(Co-ordination of Temporary Road Closures etc.) (Guernsey) Law, 2003 for

permission for the temporary closure of a road or pavement, or the application of

traffic management measures in a road, when the relevant work will involve the

resurfacing of the road or pavement. It also increases the penalty fee payable where a

person granted permission for such an application fails to comply with conditions

attached to the permission.

The Order comes into force on the 16th day of January, 2019.

4


