
GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

2020 No. 103

The Waste Management Services (Charging)

Made

Coming into operation

Laid before the States

Regulations, 2020

29(11 October, 2020

Js1 January, 2021

,2020

THE WASTE DISPOSAL AuTHORITYa, in exercise of the powers conferred

on it by sections 1 and 3 of the Waste Management Services (Charging) Ordinance,

2018b and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes the following

Regulations:

Amendment of the Waste Management Services (Charging) Ordinance, 2018.

1. The Schedule to the Waste Management Services (Charging)

Ordinance, 2018 is amended as follows—

(a) in Table A of Part I—

(i) for “€1.40” substitute “€1.50”, and

a The States’ Trading Supervisory Board is designated as the Waste Disposal
Authority under the Environmental Pollution (Designation of Waste Disposal
Authority) Ordinance, 20016 (Ordinance No. X of 2016).
1, Ordinance No. XXV of 2018.

GREFFE
ROYAL COURT

-9 NOV 2020 ‘Li~

GUERNSEY

1



(ii) for “€2.50” substitute “€270”,

(b) in Table B of Part I—

(i) for “€1.40” substitute “€1.50”, and

(ii) for “€2.50” substitute “€2.70”, and

(c) in Part II, for “€85” substitute “€90”.

Citation and commencement.

2. These Regulations may be cited as the Waste Management Services

(Charging) Regulations, 2020 and shall come into force on the P~ January, 2021.

Dated this 29th day of October, 2020

Deputy Peter Roffey

President of the States’ Trading Supervisory Board

For and on behalf of the States’ Trading Supervisory Board as Waste Disposal

Authority

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Schedule to the Waste Management Services (Charging)

Ordinance, 2018 to increase the prescribed bag charges for residual waste bags of both

sizes (up to and including 50 litres in capacity and those 51 to 90 litres in capacity).

2



They also increase the annual fixed charge.

These Regulations come into force on the P~ day of January, 2021.

3




