
ORDINANCE OF THE CHIEF PLEAS OF SARK 

Ordinance No. XV of 2020 

 

  

The Financial Provisions (Variation of Rates) (Sark) 

Ordinance, 2020 

 THE CHIEF PLEAS OF SARK, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 19th 

November, 2020, and in exercise of the powers conferred on them by sections 12, 20 

and 28 of the Financial Provisions (Sark) Law, 1978a, and all other powers enabling 

them in that behalf, hereby order:- 

Variation of taxes. 

1. In the Financial Provisions (Sark) Law, 1978 – 

(a) in the Third Schedule (rate of horse tax), for "£22" 

substitute "£25", 

(b) in the Fourth Schedule (rate of dog tax), for "£11" 

substitute "£13", and 

(c) in the Fifth Schedule (rate of cycle tax), for "£11" 

substitute "£14". 

Citation. 

2. This Ordinance may be cited as the Financial Provisions (Variation of 

Rates) (Sark) Ordinance, 2020. 

Commencement. 

3. This Ordinance shall come into force on the 1st January, 2021. 

 

a  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXVI, p. 480; amended by Order in Council No. III of 

2007; No. XV of 2014.  There are other amendments not relevant to this enactment. 


