
 

In the Royal Court of the Island of Guernsey 

    

The  
Orders of the Royal Court  

        I 

2021 

   

 

IN THE ROYAL COURT OF THE ISLAND OF GUERNSEY 
 

The 19th day of February, 2021 before Richard James McMahon, Esquire, Bailiff; 

present:- Stephen Murray Jones, Esquire, OBE, Jonathan Grenfell Hooley, Steven John 

Morris, Alan Stevenson Boyle, David John Robilliard, Stuart Michael Crisp, Esquires, 

Tina Jane Le Poidevin, Paul Martin Burnard, Esquire, Felicity Jane Quevatre-Malcic, 

Jurats.  
 

 

 

No. I Order, 2021 

 

ENTITLED 

 

THE BAR (EXAMINATION FEE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2021 

 

 

 



1 

 

 

The Bar (Examination Fee) (Amendment) 

Regulations, 2021 

 

 THE ROYAL COURT, in exercise of the powers conferred on it by sections 1 and 5 of 

the Fees, Charges and Penalties (Guernsey) Law, 20071, and all other powers enabling them 

in that behalf, hereby makes the following Regulations:- 

 

Amendment of the Bar (Examination Fee) Regulations, 2011. 

 1. (1) The Bar (Examination Fee) Regulations, 2011
2
 are amended as follows. 

 

  (2) In Regulation 1(a), for "£1,000" substitute "£1,200". 

 

  (3) In Regulation 1(b), for "£200" substitute "£300". 

 

Amendment of the Bar Ordinance, 1949. 

 2. (1) Section 5 of the Bar Ordinance, 1949
3
 is amended as follows. 

 

  (2) For "£1,000" substitute "£1,200", and for "£200" substitute "£300". 

 

Citation. 

 3. These Regulations may be cited as the Bar (Examination Fee) (Amendment) 

Regulations, 2021. 

                                                 

1  Order in Council No. VII of 2008; No. VIII of 2010; No. IV of 2016; Ordinance No. VII 

of 2008; No. IV of 2011; No. XLIII of 2013; No. XLIII of 2014; No. IX of 2016 and No. XLI of 

2017. 

2  Order of the Royal Court No. I of 2011.   
3
  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome X, p.39; Tome XX, p. 269; Ordinance No. XV of 1996; 

No. IV of 2002; No. IX of 2003; No. XXII of 2004; No. II of 2005; No. XV of 2006; No. XXXV of 

2006 and No. XXIII of 2010. 



2 

 

 

Commencement. 

 4. These Regulations shall come into force on the 19th February, 2021. 

 


