ORDER IN COUNCIL

ratifying a Projet de Loi
ENTITLED

The Gambling (Alderney)
(Amendment) Law, 2021

(Registered on the Records of the Island of Guernsey on the 4th
April, 2022.)

2022

1A%
2022



QTS

P e N DR )

In the Ropal Court of the Hsland of BGuernsey

CIIJB 4™ day of April, 2022 before Richard James McMahon, Esquire, Bailiff;
present:- Terry John Ferbrache, Jonathan Grenfell Hooley, Steven John

Morris, David James Mortimer, Esquires, Joanne Marie Wyatt, Paul
Martin Burnard Esquire, Felicity Jane Quevatre-Malcic, Simon Ernest

Bodkin, James Robert Toynton, Esquires, Jurats.
The Bailiff, having this day placed before the Court
an Order of Her Majesty in Council dated 16" March 2022, approving and ratifying a
Projet de Loi of the States of Alderney entitled “The Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment)
Law, 20217, THE COURT, after the reading of the said Order in Council and having

heard from Her Majesty’s Comptroller thereon, ORDERED:-

1. That the said Order in Council be registered on the records of this Island;
and

2. That an extract of this present Act, together with a copy of the said Order be
sent by Her Majesty’s Greffier to the Greffier of the Court of Alderney for

registration on the records of that Island.

J. TORODE
Her Majesty’s Greffier



S
?:-;@‘e ‘{.}N'«M o)) ﬂ gy
LSRNV

At the Court at Windsor Castle
THE 16th DAY OF MARCH 2022
PRESENT,

THE QUEEN’S MOST EXCELLENT MAJESTY
IN COUNCIL

The following report from the Committee of Council for the Affairs of Jersey and
Guernsey was today read at the Board:

“In accordance with Your Majesty’s General Order of Reference of 22nd February
1952 the Committee have considered a Petition of the States of Guernsey:

“That, in pursuance of their Resolution of 17th November 2021, the States of
Alderney at a meeting on 17th November 2021 approved a Projet de Loi entitled the
Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment) Law, 2021 and requested the Bailiff to present a most
humble Petition to Your Majesty in Council praying for Your Royal Sanction to it. The
Petition most humbly prays that Your Majesty might be graciously pleased to sanction the
Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment) Law, 2021 and to order that it shall have force of law in
the Island of Alderney.

“The Committee have considered the Projet de Loi and have agreed to report that it
may be advisable for Your Majesty to approve and ratify it”.

Her Majesty, having taken the report into consideration, was pleased, by and with the
advice of Her Privy Council, to approve and ratify the Projet de Loi (a copy of which is
annexed to this Order) and to order that it, together with this Order, shall have the force of
law in the Island of Alderney and shall be entered on the Register of the Island of Guernsey
and observed accordingly.

Her Majesty’s Officers in the Bailiwick of Guernsey, and all others whom it may
concern, are therefore to take notice of Her Majesty’s Order and to proceed accordingly.

Richard Tilbrook



PROJET DE LOI

ENTITLED

The Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment) Law, 2021

THE STATES OF ALDERNEY, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 17t
November, 2021 have approved the following provisions which, subject to the
Sanction of Her Most Excellent Majesty in Council, shall have force of law in the

Island of Alderney.

Amendment of the 1999 Law.

1. (1) The Gambling (Alderney) Law, 19992 is amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph (a) of section 11 (cheating to be an offence), for

"six months" substitute "12 months".

(3) In subsection (1) of section 13 (offences and penalties), for
"liable —" to the end, substitute "liable to a fine, or to imprisonment for a term not

exceeding two years, or to both.".

4) In paragraph 11(5) of Schedule 1, for "three months" substitute

"12 months".

a Order in Council No. XIV of 1999; as amended by No. XXVIII of 2001. There

are other amendments not relevant to this enactment.



Citation.

2. This Law may be cited as the Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment)
Law, 2021.
Commencement.

3. This Law shall come into force on the day appointed by Ordinance of

the States; and different dates may be appointed for different provisions and for

different purposes.



