States of
A Alderney

ORDINANCE OF THE STATES Xl of 2022

The Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees) (Amendment)

Ordinance, 2022

Made 11 January 2023

Coming into force 11 January 2023

THE STATES OF ALDERNEY, in exercise of the powers conferred on them
by sections 159 and 164 of the Companies (Alderney) Law, 1994?, and all other powers

enabling them in that behalf, hereby order:-

Amendments to the 1994 Law.

1. (1) The Companies (Alderney) Law, 1994, is amended as follows.

(2) In section 107(7) -

(a) in paragraph (a), for "£80", substitute "£200",

(b) in paragraph (b), for "£160", substitute "£400", and

(c) in paragraph (c), for "£240", substitute "£500".

a Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXXV(2), p. 777; this enactment has been amended.

1
© The States of Alderney




3) In section 108(4)(b), for "£240", substitute "£500".

(4) In section 159(1) -

(a) in paragraph (a), for "£120", substitute "£170",

(b) in paragraphs (b) and (c), for "£39", substitute "£45",

(©) in paragraph (d), for "£26", substitute "£25",

(d) in paragraph (e), for "£26", substitute "£45",

(e) in paragraphs (f) and (g), for "£61", substitute "£200",

(f) in paragraph (h), for "£39", substitute "£30",

(8) in paragraph (i), for "£39", substitute "£45",

(h) in paragraphs (j) and (k), for "£26", substitute "£45",

(1) in paragraph (1), for "£61", substitute "£60", and

0) in paragraph (m), for "£45", substitute "£30".

Amendments to the 2012 Ordinance.

2. (1) Section 4 of the Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees) Ordinance,
2012 is repealed.

) Section 5 of the Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees) Ordinance,

2012 is amended as follows -

(a) in paragraph (a), for "£33", substitute "£45",

(b) in paragraph (b), for "£33", substitute "£30",

2
© The States of Alderney



()

(d)

(e)

(f)

(8

(h)

(i)

Citation.

in paragraphs (c), (d) and (e) for "£33", substitute "£45",

in paragraphs (f) and (g), for "£33", substitute "£30",

in paragraph (h), for "£13 per company", substitute "£2

per document with a minimum charge of £10",

in paragraph (i), for "£1.25", substitute "and for the
transmission by the Registrar of an electronic copy of

any such document by electronic means, £2.00",

paragraph (j) is repealed,

in paragraph (k), for "£26", substitute "£25", and

for paragraph (1), substitute -

"(I)  for the supply by the Registrar of a Certificate
of Incumbency, £30.".

3. This Ordinance may be cited as the Companies (Alderney) Law (Fees)

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2022.

Commencement.

4. This Ordinance shall come into force on 11t January 2023.

DAVID KNIGHT
Alderney Greffier

Alderney legislation is available online at

www.guernseylegalresources.gg

3
© The States of Alderney


http://www.guernseylegalresources.gg/

