
 1 

GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT  

2023 No. 

 

The Motor Vehicles, Licensing, Tests and Traffic (Fees) 

(Guernsey) Regulations, 2023 

Made 10th February, 2023 

Coming into operation 6th March, 2023 

Laid before the States  , 2023 

 

 THE COMMITTEE FOR THE ENVIRONMENT & INFRASTRUCTURE, in 

exercise of the powers conferred on it by sections 2A and 2B of the Motor Taxation 

and Licensing (Guernsey) Law, 1987a, sections 1 and 5 of the Fees, Charges and 

Penalties (Guernsey) Law, 1987b, Article 2(2) of the Ordonnance relative aux Licences 

de Commerçant accordables à l'égard d'Automobiles en usage dans un but 

commercial, of 26th November 1932c, section 4A of the Driving Licences (Guernsey) 

Ordinance, 1995d, sections 4, 5, 8, 9 and 16 of the Registration Marks (Sale and 

 

a  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXX, p. 341; this enactment has been amended. 

b  Order in Council No. VII of 2008; this enactment has been amended. 

c  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VIII, p. 229; this enactment has been amended. 

d  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXVI, p. 374; this enactment has been amended. 

11



 2 

Retention) Ordinance, 1997e, and all other powers enabling them in that behalf, hereby 

makes the following Regulations:- 

Registration marks. 

1. (1) In Article 15(3)(b) of the Ordonnance supplémentaire à 

l'Ordonnance ayant rapport au Trafic Véhiculaire en cette Île, 1932f (exchange of 

registration marks), for "£46" substitute "£50". 

(2) The fees prescribed for the purposes of the Registration Marks 

(Sale and Retention) Ordinance, 1997 are as follows - 

(a) in section 4 (acquisition of right of retention), the sum 

of £100, 

(b) in section 5(1) (acquisition of right to reserve non-

special registration mark), the sum of £100, 

(c) in section 8(1) and (3) (issue of duplicate certificate of 

entitlement), the sum of £50, 

(d) in section 9(5)(d) (extension of right), the sum of £100, 

and for the purpose of those provisions these Regulations shall be deemed to be an 

Order of the Committee for the Environment & Infrastructure. 

 

e  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXVII, p. 401; this enactment has been amended. 

f  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome VI, p. 89; this enactment has been amended. 



 3 

Fees for trade plates. 

2. In Article 2(2) of the Ordonnance relative aux Licences de Commerçant 

accordables à l'égard d'Automobiles en usage dans un but commercial, of 26th 

November 1932 - 

(a) for "£39", in both places it appears, substitute "£43", and  

(b) for "£17.50" substitute "£20". 

Driving test and driving licence fees. 

3. In the Driving Licences (Guernsey) Ordinance, 1995 - 

(a) in the table in Schedule 2, in the second column - 

(i) for "£75", in each place it appears, substitute 

"£92", and 

(ii) for "£130", in each place it appears, substitute 

"£159", and 

(b) for the table in Schedule 3, substitute the table set out 

in the Schedule to these Regulations. 

Fees for registration. 

4. For the Table of fees in the Schedule to the Motor Taxation and 

Licensing (Fees) (Guernsey) Regulations, 2007g substitute the following table - 

 

 

g  G.S.I. No. 43 of 2007; this enactment has been amended. 



 4 

" 

Event or matter in respect of which fee is payable Amount of fee 

1.  First registration of motor vehicle £50 

2.  Issue of duplicate certificate £16 

3.  Subsequent registration of motor vehicle £33 

4.  Issue of certificate of export £16 

". 

Theory test fees. 

5. In Schedule 1 of the Driving Licences (Theory Test) (Guernsey) 

Regulations 2016h, in Column 2 of the table -  

(a) for "£38", in both places it appears, substitute "£47", and  

(b) for "£54", in both places it appears, substitute "£67". 

Revocation. 

6. The following Regulations are revoked -  

(a) the Driving Tests (Fees) Regulations, 2017i, and 

(b) the Motor Vehicles, Licensing and Traffic (Fees) 

 

h  G.S.I. No. 47 of 2016. 

i  G.S.I. No. 1 of 2017. 



 5 

(Guernsey) Regulations, 2021j. 

Citation. 

7. These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicles, Licensing and 

Traffic (Fees) (Guernsey) Regulations, 2023. 

Commencement 

8. These Regulations shall come into force on the 6th March, 2023. 

 

Dated this 10th day of February, 2023 

 

 

 

 

H. L. DE SAUSMAREZ 

President of the Committee for the Environment & Infrastructure 

For and on behalf of the Committee 

 

j  G.S.I. No. 33 of 2021. 



 6 

SCHEDULE 

Regulation 3(b) 

FEES FOR LICENCES 

" 

(1) 

Description of Licence 

(2) 

Fee 

(3) 

Next Day 

Licence 

(4) 

Same Day 

Licence 

(1) A provisional licence granted 

to a person who has not held 

a licence before 

 

£60 £80 £90 

(2) First full licence granted in 

exchange for a provisional 

licence 

 

£0.00 £20 £30 

(3) Renewal of a full or 

provisional licence 

 

£60 £80 £90 

(4) A full or provisional licence 

granted in exchange for a 

subsisting licence (other than 

a licence issued by the 

competent authority in a 

country outside the Island) 

or in place of a licence 

revoked pursuant to section 

9(1) of this Ordinance 

(surrender of driving 

licences) except -  

 

(a) where the licence 

granted is a first full 

£33 £53 £63 



 7 

licence granted in 

exchange for a 

provisional licence; or 

(b) where the subsisting 

or revoked licence is 

surrendered pursuant 

to section 9(1) or (2) 

of this Ordinance and 

the Committee is 

required to grant a 

new licence free of 

charge 

 

(5) A licence issued in exchange 

for a licence issued by the 

competent authority in a 

country outside the Island 

 

£60 £80 £90 

(6) The first licence granted to a 

person after the expiration of 

a period of disqualification 

imposed upon him by an 

order of the court where –  

 

(a) the licence will 

remain in force for 

less than six years 

(b) the licence will 

remain in force for 

more than six years, 

for each year or part 

thereof until its 

expiration 

 

 

 

 

£33 

 

£6 

 

 

 

£53 

 

The fee 

calculated in 

column (2) 

plus £20 

 

 

 

£63 

 

The fee 

calculated 

in column 

(2) plus £30 

(7) A licence granted pursuant 

to section 11(2) of the 

principal Law 

£33 £53 £63 

(8) A duplicate licence £33 £53 £63 

". 



 8 

 

 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

 

These Regulations increase the fees payable with effect from 6th March 2023 in relation 

to - 

• the exchange and retention of registration marks, 

• trade plate renewals, 

• the issue and renewal of driving licences and of duplicate licences, 

• first and subsequent registration of motor vehicles and the issue of duplicate 

registration certificates and certificates of export, 

• driving tests and theory tests. 

 

The increases are generally based on the increases in RPIX since the last review. 

 

These Regulations will come into force on the 6th March 2023. 

 


