GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

2023 No. 92

The Waste Management Services (Charging)

Regulations, 2023
Made 30 October, 2023
Coming into operation 1# January, 2024
Laid before the States , 2023

THE WASTE DISPOSAL AUTHORITY?, in exercise of the powers conferred
on it by sections 1 and 3 of the Waste Management Services (Charging) Ordinance,
2018P and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes the following

Regulations:-

Amendment of the Waste Management Services (Charging) Ordinance, 2018.

) 8 The Schedule to the Waste Management Services (Charging)

Ordinance, 2018 is amended as follows -

(a) in Table A of PartI-

(i) for "£1.70" substitute "£1.79", and

a The States' Trading Supervisory Board is designated as the Waste Disposal

Authority under the Environmental Pollution (Designation of Waste Disposal
Authority) Ordinance, 2016 (Ordinance No. X of 2016).

b Ordinance No. XXV of 2018; this enactment has been amended.



(ii) for "£3.07" substitute "£3.22",

(b) in Table B of Part I -

(1) for "£1.70" substitute "£1.79", and

(ii) for "£3.07" substitute "£3.22", and

(c) in Part II, for "£102.97" substitute "£107.97".

Revocation.
2. The Waste Management Services (Charging) (No.2) Regulations, 2022¢

are revoked.

Citation and commencement.

3 These Regulations may be cited as the Waste Management Services

(Charging) Regulations, 2023 and shall come into force on the 1% January, 2024.

Dated this 30t day of October, 2023

Deputy P. I._lioffey
President of the States' Trading Supervisory Board
For and on behalf of the States’ Trading Supervisory Board as Waste Disposal
Authority

% G.S.I. No. 71 of 2022.



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Schedule to the Waste Management Services (Charging)
Ordinance, 2018 to increase the prescribed bag charges for residual waste bags of both
sizes (up to and including 50 litres in capacity and those 51 to 90 litres in capacity) by
5%. They also increase the annual fixed charge for waste management services

provided by the Waste Disposal Authority by £5.

The charges have been increased in line with the resolutions made by the States of
Deliberation at their meeting on 8th September 2022 (Resolutions 4 and 5 of Article [V
of Billet d"Etat XIII of 2022) that the household charges should be increased annually
from 2023 to 2025 by no more than an annual increase of RPIX plus 1% (capped at 5%)
to the “pay as you throw” bag charge for general waste and by no more than an
increase of RPIX plus 1% (capped at £5) per year to the Waste Disposal Authority’s

annual waste charge.

These Regulations come into force on the 1+t January, 2024.



