
 

In the Royal Court of the Island of Guernsey 
    

The 
Orders of the Royal Court                      

VI 
2024 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

IN THE ROYAL COURT OF THE ISLAND OF GUERNSEY 
 
The 14th day of October, 2024 before Jessica Elizabeth Roland, Deputy Bailiff;  
present: Stephen Murray Jones, OBE, Esquire, Claire Helen Le Pelley, Jonathan,  
Grenfell Hooley, Steven John Morris, David John Robilliard, Stuart Michael Crisp, 
Esquires, Marilyn Jasmine King, Tina Jane Le Poidevin, Simon Ernest Bodkin, James 
Robert Toynton, Esquires, Jillian Clark, Richard Jeremy Wallen James, Ian Michael 
Brown, Esquires, Kay Alison Parnwell, Jurats. 
 
 

No.VI Order, 2024 

ENTITLED 

THE MATRIMONIAL CAUSES (COSTS AND FEES) (AMENDMENT) 

RULES, 2024 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

1



The Matrimonial Causes 

(Costs and Fees) (Amendment) Rules, 2024 

 

THE ROYAL COURT, in exercise of the powers conferred upon it by section 

49 of the Matrimonial Causes (Bailiwick of Guernsey) Law, 2022a, section 34 of the 

Domestic Proceedings and Magistrate's Court (Guernsey) Law, 1988b, section 121 of 

the Children (Guernsey and Alderney) Law, 2008c and all other powers enabling it in 

that behalf, hereby orders:- 

 

 

Amendment of the Rules. 

1. (1) The Matrimonial Causes (Costs and Fees) Rules, 2024d ("the 

Rules") are amended as follows. 

(2) In the Schedule to the Rules –  

(a) in item 3, in the third column, for "£462" substitute 

"£127", 

(b) for item 4, substitute the following –  

 

 
a  Order in Council No. I of 2023. 
b  Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXXI, p. 171; this enactment has been amended. 
c  Order in Council No. XIV of 2009; this enactment has been amended. 
d  O. R. C. No. IV of 2024. 

2



" 

4. Preparatory reading by a judge and 
writing of judgment in respect of any 
proceedings, unless the judge 
otherwise directs and provided that no 
fee shall be payable for the first hour of 
such reading time or the first hour of 
such writing time. 

Court:  £213 per hour or part 
thereof (in excess of the 
first hour). 

", and 

(c) for item 9, in the third column, for "£462" substitute 

"£127". 

Citation. 

2. These Regulations may be cited as the Matrimonial Causes (Costs and 

Fees) (Amendment) Rules, 2024. 

Commencement. 

3. These Rules come into force on the day on which they are made. 

3


	ORC 6 - The Matrimonial Causes (Costs and Fees) (Amendment) Rules, 2024.pdf (p.1)
	The Matrimonial Causes (Costs and Fees) (Amendment) Rules, 2024(1665135.4).pdf (p.2-3)
	1. Amendment of the Rules.
	2. Citation.
	3. Commencement.


