
 

 

GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT 

2024 No. 

 

The Public Transport (Fees) (Guernsey) 

Regulations, 2024 

 

 

 

 

 

THE COMMITTEE FOR THE ENVIRONMENT & INFRASTRUCTURE, in 

exercise of the powers conferred upon it by sections 1 and 5 of the Fees, Charges and 

Penalties (Guernsey) Law, 2007a, and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, 

hereby makes the following Regulations:- 

 

Amendment of the Road Traffic (Permits to Drive Public Service Vehicles) 

Ordinance, 1986. 

1. (1) The Road Traffic (Permits to Drive Public Service Vehicles) 

Ordinance, 1986b is amended as follows. 

 

a  Order in Council No. VII of 2008; this enactment has been amended. 

b  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXIII, p.393; this enactment has been amended. 

Made 18th November, 2024 

Coming into operation 19th November, 2024  

Laid before the States , 2024 

93



 

 

(2) In section 4(4) – 

(a) in paragraph (a)(i), for "£88" substitute "£92",  

(b) in paragraph (a)(ii), for "£12.50" substitute "£14", and 

(c) in paragraph (b), for "£63" substitute "£65.50". 

(3) In section 7, for "£21" substitute "£22.50".  

(4) In the Schedule -  

(a) in relation to the fee to accompany an application, for 

"£13.50" substitute "£14",  

(b) in relation to the fee for the grant of a 4 year permit, for 

"£84" substitute "£90", and 

(c) in relation to the fee for the renewal of a 4 year permit, 

for "£84" substitute "£90". 

Amendment of the Public Transport Ordinance, 1986. 

2. (1) The Public Transport Ordinance, 1986c is amended as follows. 

(2) In section 12 -  

(a) in subsection (1), for "£50" substitute "£52.50", 

(b) in subsection (2), for "£21" substitute "£22.50", and 

(c) in subsection (3), for "£21" substitute "£22.50". 

 

c  Recueil d'Ordonnances Tome XXIII, p. 351; this enactment has been amended. 



 

 

(3) In section 14(3), for "£25" substitute "£26.50". 

(4) In section 42(6) -  

(a) in paragraph (a), for "£37.50" substitute "£39.50", 

(b) in paragraph (b), for "£54" substitute "£56", and 

(c) in paragraph (c), for "£16" substitute "£16.50". 

Citation. 

3. These Regulations may be cited as the Public Transport (Fees) 

(Guernsey) Regulations, 2024. 

Commencement. 

4. These Regulations shall come into force on 19th November, 2024. 

Dated this 18th day of November, 2024 

 

DEPUTY H. L. DE SAUSMAREZ 

President of the Committee for the Environment & Infrastructure 

For and on behalf of the Committee 

 
 

  



 

 

___________________________________________________________________________ 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Regulations) 

The Regulations amend the Road Traffic (Permits to Drive Public Service Vehicles) 

Ordinance, 1986 to increase the fees payable for a driving test to assess an applicant's 

ability to drive a public services vehicle, an Island knowledge test, and in respect of 

the application for or grant or renewal of a permit.  

These Regulations also amend the Public Transport Ordinance 1986 to increase the 

fees for- 

(a) the grant or renewal of a public service vehicle licence,  

(b) the grant of a public service vehicle license on a 

temporary basis whilst a vehicle is undergoing repair, 

(c) the grant of a licence in respect of a vehicle which is to 

permanently replace a vehicle with an existing licence,  

(d) the transfer of a public service vehicle licence,  

(e) an application for a road service licence, or to vary such 

a licence, and 

(f) the examination of public service vehicles.  

The amount to which each fee has been increased has been calculated to reflect the 

increase in RPIX since that fee was last increased, and rounded to the nearest £0.50. 

These Regulations come into force on 19th November, 2024. 


