GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

2025 No. 101

The Limited Partnerships (Fees) (Amendment)

Regulations, 2025
Made 28t October, 2025
Coming into operation 1¢t December, 2025
Laid before the States , 2025

THE COMMITTEE FOR ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, in exercise of the

powers conferred on it by sections 36(1)(c), 43 and 44 of the Limited Partnerships

(Guernsey) Law, 1995", and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, and after

consultation with the Guernsey Financial Services Commission, hereby makes the

following Regulations:-

Amendment of the Limited Partnerships (Fees, Annual Validations and

Miscellaneous Provisions) Regulations, 2016.

1. (1) The Limited Partnerships (Fees, Annual Validations and

b
Miscellaneous Provisions) Regulations, 2016  are amended as follows.

(2) For the Schedule, substitute the Schedule set out in the Schedule

to these Regulations.

a Ordres en Conseil Vol. XXXVI, p. 264; this enactment has been amended.

G.S.1. No. 51 of 2016; this enactment has been amended.



Amendment of section 36 of the Limited Partnerships (Guernsey) Law, 1995.

2. (1) Section 36(1) of the Limited Partnerships (Guernsey) Law, 1995

("the Law") is amended as follows.
2) For paragraph (a)(i) substitute -
"(i) a declaration under section 8(2)(d) -

(A) a fee of £500, where fast track
registration of the partnership
(within 2 hours) is requested,

or

(B) a fee of £100, where standard
registration of the partnership
(within 24  hours) is

requested,".
(2) For paragraph (a)(ii) substitute -

"(ii) notice of change of particulars or of
general partners under section 10(1),
the fee specified in regulation 3 of the
Limited Partnerships (Fees)

Regulations, 2025,".
(3) In paragraph (a)(iii), for "£25" substitute "£15".

4) In paragraph (a)(iv), for "£25" substitute "£15".



Fees payable upon filing of notice of change of particulars or of general partners

3. (1) For the purposes of section 36(1)(a)(ii) of the Law, the fee

specified as payable upon filing of a notice of change of particulars or of general

partners under section 10(1) of the Law shall be -

(a)

(b)

(d)

(e)

£50, where there is a change in the particulars of the
governance provisions of the partnership agreement

referred to in section 8(2)(b) of the Law,

£25, where there is a change is to the name of the

partnership referred to in section 8(2)(d)(i) of the Law,

£25, where there is a change to -

(i) the principal place of business of the
partnership referred to in section 8(2)(d)(ii) of

the Law, or

(if) the partnership's registered office referred to in

section 8(2)(d)(iii) of the Law,

£15, where there is a change to the particulars of the
general partners referred to in section 8(2)(d)(iv) of the

Law, and

£15, where there is a change to any registered

particulars not referred to in subparagraphs (a) - (d).

(2) For the avoidance of doubt, where a notice is filed of a change

in more than one registered particular the fee payable under paragraph (1) shall be the

total of each of the applicable fees specified in subparagraphs (a) to (e).



Citation.
4. These Regulations may be cited as the Limited Partnerships (Fees)

(Amendment) Regulations, 2025.

Commencement.

5. These Regulations shall come into force on the 1%t day of December,

2025.

Dated this 28" day of October, 2025

DEPUTY A. KAZANTSEVA-MILLER
President of the States Committee for Economic Development

For and on behalf of the Committee



SCHEDULE

Regulation 1(2)
"SCHEDULE
Regulation 2
FEES
(1) @) 3)
SERVICE IN RESPECT OF FEE NOTES
WHICH FEE PAYABLE These notes are only for
the purposes of general
guidance and are
without prejudice to any
provision of, or liability
arising under, the Law
or these Regulations
Annual Validation fee £525
Change of Resident Agent | £15
Corporate Actions
Applications
Migration In (Application | £100 Limited partnerships
for registration of overseas supervised by the
limited partnership as a Commission must
Guernsey limited have prior
partnership) Commission consent.
Migration Out £2500
(Application to transfer
registration to another
jurisdiction)
Document filing
Late document filing fee, £5 per day after filing

unless the limited

deadline date, capped at




partnership is liable to be
issued with a civil penalty
under section 10(2)(a) of
the Law

£500

Document/Enquiry
Orders

Statement of the Register

£15 (electronic copy)
£50 (certified electronic

copy)
£100 (certified paper copy)

Certificate of Good

£15 (electronic copy)

Standing £50 (certified electronic
copy)
£100 (certified paper copy)
Copy of Certificate £15 (electronic copy)

£50 (certified electronic

copy)
£100 (certified paper copy)

Copy of Particulars of
Governance

£15 (electronic copy)
£50 (certified electronic

copy)
£100 (certified paper copy)

Copy of an entire limited
partnership File

£100

Can only be requested
by the limited
partnership to which
the request relates

Copy of all public
information which is
available free of charge on
the Register of Limited
Partnerships.

£150

Unusual document/ad hoc
service/exceptional service
charges

£25, plus such additional
amount as may be advised
by the Registrar, dependent
upon the complexity of the
request.

This fee applies where
a request, in the
reasonable opinion of
the Registrar, will
result in excessive
work volumes and/or
is an excessive burden
upon registry
resources.




The amount of the
charge will be advised
in advance of any
work being
undertaken by the
Registrar.

Report of all limited

partnerships with a given

resident agent

£250

This can only be
requested by the given
resident agent.

(Where a request is
made for a report of
all legal persons
(including companies,
limited partnerships,
limited liability
partnerships and
foundations) with a
given resident agent,
the total fee charged in
respect of such a
request will be £250.)

Report of all limited

partnerships recorded at a

given registered office

£350

This can only be
requested by a
corporate services
provider in respect of
a registered office
address provided by
that corporate services
provider.

(Where a request is
made by a corporate
services provider for
reports of all legal
persons (including
companies, limited
partnerships, limited
liability partnerships
and foundations) with
a specified registered
office, the total fee




charged in respect of
such a request will be
£250.)




EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations, made under the Limited Partnerships (Guernsey) Law, 1995,
amend the Limited Partnerships (Fees, Annual Validations and Miscellaneous
Provisions) Regulations, 2016, by substituting the Schedule of fees payable to the
Registrar of Companies in respect of services in relation to limited partnerships. They
also amend the fees payable to the Registrar of Companies under section 36 of the
Limited Partnerships (Guernsey) Law, 1995 upon the filing of certain documents by

limited partnerships.

These Regulations come into force on the 1+t day of December, 2025.



