GUERNSEY STATUTORY INSTRUMENT

2025 No. 128

The Births and Deaths Certificates (Fees)

Regulations, 2025
Made 9t December, 2025
Coming into operation I¢* January, 2026
Laid before the States , 2025

THE POLICY & RESOURCES COMMITTEE, in exercise of the powers

conferred upon it by sections 1 and 5 of the Fees, Charges and Penalties (Guernsey)
Law, 20072, and all other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes the following

Regulations:-

Amendment of Fees.

L The 'Births, Deaths and Marriages Certificates (Miscellaneous

Provisions) (Guernsey) Law, 1951P is amended as follows —

(a) in section 1(2), for "£20.00" substitute "£30.00",

a Order in Council No. VII of 2008; this enactment has been amended.

b Ordres en Conseil Vol. XV, p. 46; this enactment has been amended.



(b) in section 1(3), for "£30.00" substitute "£40.00, and

(c) in section 2, for "£30.00" substitute "£40.00".

Revocations.

2. The Births and Death Certificates (Fees) Regulations, 2023 are revoked.

Citation.

3. These Regulations may be cited as the Births and Death Certificates

(Fees) Regulations, 2025.

Commencement.

4. These Regulations shall come into force on the 1* January, 2026.

Dated this q1~\—— day of WZOZS

DEPUTY L. DE SAUSMAREZ
President of the Policy & Resources Committee

For and on behalf of the Committee

M\M& 2

C

G. S. 1. No. 132 of 2023.



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations increase the fees payable for the issue of birth and death certificates

and will come into force on 1st January, 2026.






