% s
'w b‘r?{ ot

t
Mnu BT TAMON DROITK

In the Ropal Court of the lelanh of Guerngey

Orders of the Royal Court
VI
2025

IN THE ROYAL COURT OF GUERNSEY

The 15" day of December, 2025 before Jessica Elizabeth Roland, Deputy Bailiff; present:
- Stephen Murray Jones, OBE, Claire Helen Le Pelley, Steven John Morris, Stuart
Michael Crisp, Tina Jane Le Poidevin, Felicity Jane Quevitre, Simon Ernest Bodkin,
Jillian Clark, Richard Jeremy Wallen James, Ian Michael Brown, Kay Alison Parnwell,
Sally-Ann May David, Susan Elizabeth Gallienne, Jurats.

No. VI Order, 2025

ENTITLED

THE CAPACITY (LASTING POWERS OF ATTORNEY) (APPEALS, etc.)
(AMENDMENT) RULES, 2025



The Capacity (Lasting Powers of Attorney)
(Appeals, etc.) (Amendment) Rules, 2025

THE ROYAL COURT, in exercise of the powers conferred upon it by section

83 of the Capacity (Bailiwick of Guernsey) Law, 2020%, section 20(c) of the

Interpretation and Standard Provisions (Bailiwick of Guernsey) Law, 2016b, and all

other powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby orders:-

Amendment to Rules.

1. (1) The Capacity (Lasting Powers of Attorney) (Appeals, etc.)

Rules, 2022¢ ("the principal Rules") are amended as follows.

(2) In the principal Rules, for "Her Majesty's Greffier", wherever it

occurs, substitute "His Majesty's Greffier".
(3) In rule 2, for "Part 1" substitute "Part I".
(4) In rule 5(2), renumber subparagraph (f) as subparagraph (e).
(5) In rule 7 -
(a) in paragraph 1(a) —

(1) in item (i), for "£88" substitute "£91",

a Order in Council No. II of 2021; this enactment has been amended.

Order in Council No. V of 2018; this enactment has been amended.

¢ O. R. C. No. IV of 2022; this enactment has been amended.



(i)  initem (ii), for "£110" substitute "£114",

(b) in paragraph 1(b), for "£33" substitute "£34",
(©) in paragraph 1(c), for "£33" substitute "£34",
(d) in paragraph (2), for "£165" substitute "£171", and
(e) in paragraph (3), for "£22" substitute "£23".
Repeals.
2. The Capacity (Lasting Powers of Attorney) (Appeals, etc.)
(Amendment) Rules, 20234 are repealed.
Citation.
3. These Rules may be cited as the Capacity (Lasting Power of Attorney)

(Appeals, etc.) (Amendment) Rules, 2025.

Commencement.

4. These Rules come into force on the 1t January, 2026.

d  O.R. C.No.V of 2023.



	VI.pdf (p.1)
	The Capacity (Lasting Powers of Attorney) (Appeals, etc) (Amendment) Rules, 2025.pdf (p.2-3)

