SARK STATUTORY INSTRUMENT
2025 No. 2

The Motor Vehicles (Amendment) (Sark) Regulations,

2025
Made 20" November, 2025
Coming into operation , 2025
Laid before the Chief Pleas , 2025

THE SARK CHIEF PLEAS DOUZAINE, in exercise of the powers conferred
on it by sections 6, 17, 21, 22, 24, 26, 29, 30B and 41 of the Motor Vehicles (Sark) Law,

20132, and all other powers enabling them in that behalf, hereby orders:-

Amendments to Regulations.

1 The Motor Vehicles (Sark) Regulations, 2014b ("the Regulations") are

amended as follows.

2. In regulation 2, for "£100" substitute "£300".

3. In regulation 8, for "£10" substitute "£20".

4. In regulation 11 -

a Order in Council No. XV of 2013; this enactment has been amended.

b gark Statutory Instrument No. I of 2014.


dmrobinson
FreeText
2�


(@) the second subparagraph (b) is renumbered as (ba), and

(b) subparagraph (c) is revoked.

5. After regulation 11 insert —

"

Electric bicycle licences: fees.
11A. For the purposes of section 30B of the Law, the fee for the grant

and renewal of an electric bicycle licence is £18."

6. In regulation 12(2), in both places it appears, for "£100" substitute
"£300".

7. In Schedule 1, for "£100" in each place where it appears substitute
|l||£300"l

8. In Schedule 2, for "£10" in each place where it appears substitute "£20",

9. In Schedule 4, delete "(INCLUDING ELECTRIC BICYCLES)" in each

place where it appears.

10. For Schedule 5, substitute the Schedule set out in Scheduile 1 to these

Regulations.

11.  InSchedule 6, for "£100" in each place where it occurs substitute "£300",

12.  After Schedule 7, insert Schedule 8 set out in Schedule 2 to these

Regulations.



Citation.
13.  These Regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicles (Amendment)
(Sark) Regulations, 2025.

Commencement

14.  These Regulations shall come into force on the 1¢ January, 2026.

Dated this 20% day of November, 2025
t//;v:ﬁ’//&__/

MIKE LOCKE

Chairman of the Douzaine

For and on behalf of the Douzaine



SCHEDULE 1

Regulation 10
"Regulation 9
SCHEDULE 5
SARK DOUZAINE

INVALID CARRIAGE DRIVING LICENCE APPLICATION FORM

1. Name

2 Address and contact telephone number
3. Date of birth

I enclose:

(i) afeeof £20,

(ii)  a copy of my invalid carriage driving competency test pass certificate,
and

(iil) a copy of a doctor’s certificate relating to my need for an invalid

carriage.

Signed:

Dated:



SARK DOUZAINE
INVALID CARRIAGE DRIVING LICENCE RENEWAL FORM

1L Name
2; Address and contact telephone number
3. Date of birth

4, Number of current invalid carriage driving licence

I enclose a fee of £20,
AND
I enclose a copy of a doctor’s certificate relating to my need for an invalid carriage.

OR
I declare that the Sark Chief Pleas Douzaine may contact my doctor to confirm that I

still need to use an invalid carriage.
(delete as appropriate)
Signed:

Dated:



SARK DOUZAINE
TEMPORARY INVALID CARRIAGE DRIVING LICENCE APPLICATION

FORM
Name
2, Address and contact telephone number
3 Date of birth
4. Period of use of invalid carriage (maximum 3 months)

From:

To:

I enclose a copy of a doctor’s certificate relating to my need for an invalid carriage.

Signed:

Dated:



SCHEDULE 2
Regulation 12
"Regulation 11A
SCHEDULE 8
SARK DOUZAINE
ELECTRIC BICYCLE LICENCE APPLICATION/RENEWAL FORM
1. Name
2.  Address and contact telephone number
3.  Date of birth

4.  Description of electric bicycle, including make, model and maximum

power.

I enclose a fee of £18.



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the fees payable in respect of tractor licences, tractor driving

licences, construction vehicles and electric bicycle licences.

These Regulations will come into force on the 1+ January 2026.



